UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:		:

SONY BMG CD

TECHNOLOGIES LITIGATION : Case No. 1:05-cv-09575-NRB

DECLARATION OF LAWRENCE E. FELDMAN IN SUPPORT OF PLAINTIFFS' APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES

SONY DRM EFF Fees and Costs Summary

TOTAL: \$461,930.32

Fees:

ATTORNEY	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
Cindy Cohn	379	\$500/hour	\$189,500.00
Kurt Opsahl	288.75	425	108,281.25
Corynne McSherry	271.1	375	101,662.50
Fred von Lohmann	13	450	5,850.00
Jason Schultz	17	375	6,375.00
Allison Navone, paralegal	49.75	135	6,716.25
		SUB-TOTAL	\$418,385.00

Costs:

iSec Partners			34,400.00
Bruce Schneier			4,000.00
EFF travel and other costs			5,145.07
		SUB-TOTAL	43,545.07

Fees: \$418,385.25

Costs: <u>\$43,545.07</u>

EFF Total: \$461,930.32

<u>Date</u>	Cindy Cohn Sony Time	<u>Hours</u>
11/8/05	Consider solicitation rules; draft blog post and newsletter; call for stories; review XCP EULA; consider litigation strategy	4.5
11/10/05	Consider §17200 cases memo, possible clients	1.0
11/11/05	Consider Penal Code §502 cases, CFAA analysis; telephone call with consultant; send reference materials	3.0
11/12/05	Telephone call with consultant re his findings and declaration; review blog post; legal research re preliminary injunction motion standards	3.5
11/13/05	Consider potential plaintiffs; review open letter to Sony	1.0
11/14/05	Consider potential plaintiffs; consider causes of action	1.5
11/15/05	Telephone call with Mr. Cunard; telephone call with consultant; consider strategy	2.5
11/16/05	Telephone call with Mr. Cunard; draft list of issues to discuss	1.0
11/17/05	Review new demand letter; telephone call with consultant re uninstaller vulnerability; telephone call with Sony to report; draft email to	4.5
11/18/05	Review letter from Sony and consider strategy; consider causes of action and revised complaint	4.0
11/19/05	Consider complaint strategy	0.5
11/20/05	Review and revised complaint; draft press release and website	4.0
11/21/05	Finalize complaint; revise p.r. and website; respond to media; review Texas case	7.0
11/22/05	Consider strategy re New York case, preliminary injunction	3.0
11/23/05	TT with TX AG's office. TT co-counsel to report	1.0
11/24/05	Consider experts, review Sunncomm response. Review team emails.	2.0
11/27/05	Review early XCP history, response by ATO records, consider case and counsel strategy. Consider possible MediaMax security problem.	2.5
11/28/05	Consider preliminary injunction. Review early First4 Internet information, Review Sunncomm settlement. Consider Canadian issues. Consider MediaMax security problem. Discusss with iSec.	8.0

11/29/05	Consider MediaMax vulnerability and strategy. Discuss with consultants. Email with potential experts. Review NY complaint. Track other class actions filed. Review revised PI motion.	12.0
11/30/05	Consider mediaMax vulnerability strategy. Review vulnerability report. Draft letter to Sony re: new MediaMax security problems. Call from Sony re: delay in public release.	10.0
12/1/05	Call with Sony re: new vulnerability. Consider experts and dr emails to potential experts.	10.0
12/2/04	Review PI draft. Consider client issue.	4.0
12/5/04	Consider package of measures from Sony. Discuss with Sony. Discuss with co-counsel. Review XCP uninstaller and seek reverse engineering protection. Draft joint press release. Comment on draft response to Sony.	10.0
12/6/05	Continue to draft joint press release and discuss with Sony. Continue to revise responsive letter to Sony and call with team to discuss.	10.0
12/7/05	Discuss problem in Mediamax fix with experts and Felten. Write to Sony re: recall. Multiple Calls with Sony re: recall and problems. Consider issue re: Kamber/Pritzker class counsel. Discuss with co-counsel. Consider PI strategy. Call with Elizabeth P.	12.0
12/8/05	Call with Kamber/Pritzker class counsel. Consider strategy. Email and call to Sony re: same. Call with cocounsel. Email to Sony re: notice process. Call with Sony re: advertising campaign. Consider letter to court.	10.0
12/9/05	Consider Kamber/Pritzker complaints. Consider new patch and uninstaller with experts. Discussions with Ms. Pritzker about seeing settlement draft and EFF team role. Discussions with Sony re: settlement and seeing draft. Conference call to consider strategy. Review draft of letter to court re: CMO.	11.0
12/10/05	Revise letter to NY court re: CMO. Consider strategy. Continue discussions with Ms. P re settlement.	8.0
12/11/05	Revise letter to NY court. Consider strategy. Discuss strategy with Mr. Rothken and Mr. Baker.	3.0
12/12/05	Telephone calls and emails with Ms. Pritzker re: settlement documents and EFF team role. Consider strategy with co counsel. DR letter to Sony re: settlement options. Revise letter to court re: response to CMO. Discuss Klemm case with Mr. Rothken.	12.0

12/13/05	Review settlement draft and consider strategy with cocounsel. Discuss settlement with Sony. Consider NY trip. Consider MediaMax additions to settlement and other additions needed. Discuss with cocounsel.	10.0
12/14/05	Consider strategy with co-counsel. Discuss settlement options with Sony BMG counsel over several calls.	5.0
12/15/05	Discuss strategy with Ms. Pritzker. Consider settlement meeting strategy and draft negotiation document.	4.0
12/16/06	Strategy call with cocounsel. Prep for meeting with Sony. Consider potential security people and security response strategy.	10.0
12/17/05	Fly to New York. Prep for meeting with SonyBMG. Review settlement motion documents.	12.0
12/18/05	Settlement meeting with Sony	16.0
12/19/05	Telephone call with Sony re: moving CMC. Call and email with with cocounsel to report meeting and consider strategy. Gather fees. Call with Ms. Pritzker re: next steps. Discuss case with Mr. Baker	14.0
12/20/05	Dr emails re: additional documents for settlement and next steps. Consider strategy. Fly home from NY. Discuss with cocounsel.	8.0
12/21/05	Review Settlement Notice forms. DR email re: banner notice. Review banners used currently for MediaMax 5.	10,0
12/22/05	Call with TX Ag's office. Revise email re: proposed banners. Consider strategy re: Sony and re: Pritzker/Kamber. Consider edits to notices.	10.0
12/23/05	Review Settlement Agreement and draft comments. Call with Pritzker firm re: changes in settlement. Call with Sony re: changes in settlement. Consider strategy.	10.0
12/24/05	Call with Sony re: settlement agreement changes. Consider strategy.	3.0
12/25/05	Consider strategy re: settlement agreement changes. DR email to cocounsel to discuss.	2.0
12/26/05	Call with team re: backsliding. Consider strategy. Review settlement documents.	3.0
12/27/05	Review Final Order and email changes to cocounsel.	3.0
12/28/05	DR email to Sony re: unfinished settlment matters. Consider input from cocounsel and strategy. Consider email from	3.0

Pritzker.

12/29/05	DR email to team evaluating settlement. Respond to press calls and emails and consider strategy. DR statement for website and for press. Review press and blog coverage.	3.0
12/30/05	Respond to press and public calls and emails. Consider strategy. Review press and blog coverage.	2.0
1/2/06	Review press and public responses. Consider next steps.	2.0
1/3/05	Consider strategy with cocounsel. Letter to Sony re; next steps. Letter to Pritzker re: designation document. Plan for EFF website, FAQ, etc. Respond to press calls re: settlement.	6.0
1/4/06	Consider strategy re: meeting with Sony. Plan for trip to New York. Send info to consultant re; banners and landing page.	5.0
1/5/06	Fly to New York. Plan for meeting with Sony, landing page, banners, FAQ DR email to Sony re: meeting issues. Discuss look of banners, etc. with consultant.	6.0
1/6/06	Meeting with Sony BMG. Attend hearing on preliminary approval. Email team with results of hearing. Consider strategy.	10.0
1/7/06	DR email to Sony BMG counsel confirming agreements made in meeting and discussing next steps. DR list of remaining issues.	6.0
1/8/06	Respond to class members about settlement concerns. Update FAQ.	3.0
1/9/06	Continue to respond to class members about settlement concerns.	.5
1/12/06	Email and telephone call with Mr. Cunard re Sony BMG's concerns about EFF's FAQ. Draft response	4.0
1/13/06	Review email to Mr. Cunard re: meeting with EFF.	1.0
1/17/06	DR emails re: concerns and suggestions about notice language and review responses from Mr. Jacobsen. Review revised banners from consultant	3.0
1/19/06	Review and comment on revised banners from consultant	1.0
1/20/06	Dr. email to Ms. Pritzker re; delegation agreement. Review corrspondence re: full form notice.	1.0
1/30/06	Email to Mr. Jacobson re: unaddressed notice issues and other things promised by Sony BMG at Jan 5 meeting. Conference call re: Friedman meeting with Sony BMG.	3.0

1/31/06	Review email from Mr. Jacobson re: amendment to settlement documents filed without our approval. Consider strategy. Draft response.	4.0
2/1/06	Consider strategy re: amended settlement document. Review and comment on letter to the Court.	2.0
2/2/06	Call with Sony re: objection to court. Consider strategy. Review letter sent by Sony to the court. Review revised banners. Call with Mr. Cunard re: settlement amendment and other issues.	3.0
2/3/06	Call with Judge Buchwald's clerk. Consider strategy in light of call from Mr. Cunard. Review letter from Girard Gibbs to Court re: amended settlement. Draft responsive letter to court. Call with team re: strategy. Review alternate benefit language. Call with Sony BMG and Girard Gibbs re: change to settlement language. DR email to Sony BMG re: delegation agreement dispute.	5.0
2/4/06	Review proposed stipulation and order re: amending settlement agreement.	.3
2/5/06	Continue to negotiate stipulation and order re: amending settlement.	.1
2/6/06	Review and revise letter to Pritzker re: delegation agreement.	1.0
2/7/06	Continue to negotiate stipulation and order amending settlement. Review settlement website and provide comments.	3.3
2/8/06	Continue to review settlement website and provide comments. Review banner and provide comments.	2.2
2/10/06	Review email from Mr. Jacobson stating that no MediaMax 3.0 CDs have banner functionality and only six MediaMax 5.0 CDs do. Consider strategy. Draft response.	1.0
2/13/06	Review response from Pritzker and draft reply.	2.0
2/14/06	Finalize reply to Pritzker.	.6
2/15/06	DR email to Sony BMG re: delegation agreement.	1.2
2/20/06	Prep for meeting with Pritzker. Consider and draft response to cancellation of meeting. Review response from Pritzker. Confirm no MediaMax 3.0 CDs with bannering function with Sony BMG.	1.2
2/22/06	Draft letter to Sony BMG re: additional notice in light of lack of banners.	2.1
2/23/06	Finalize letter.	.5

2/27/06	Meeting with Girard Gibbs attorneys. Consider strategy. Review response from Jacobson re: additional notice.	3.0
3/1/06	Telephone call with Ms. Pritzker re: additional notice and related delegation issues.	2.4
3/3/06	Consider strategy and dr email to team.	.8
3/7/06	Draft email to Ms. Pritzker on delegation agreement and review response. Finalize EFF banners re: settlement	.3
3/9/06	Review response from Ms. Pritzker and draft reply.	.5
3/13/06	Draft response to Sony BMG re: banners and attack on EFF banners.	1.5
3/16/06	Review response from Sony BMG re: attack on EFF banners.	.3
3/17/06	Draft response to Sony BMG	1.5
3/20/06	Finalize response to Sony BMG	.5
3/22/06	Review timesheets for Cindy and Corynne.	1.5
	Cindy Cohn Total	387.8 387.8

SONY TIME-Corynne McSherry

DATE	TIME	WORK PERFORMED
11/10/05	1.5	Review complaints New York and Chicago
		complaints; Review contract research
11/15/05	2.0	Conference with co-counsel re: next steps;
		correspondence re same
11/17/05	8.0	Review and revise complaint
11/14/05	6.5	Telephone conference with opposing counsel; meet
		and confer with co-counsel re same
11/15/05	2.5	Confer with potential class representatives
11/16/05	4.0	Confer with potential class representatives; telephone
		call with opposing counsel re open letter and
		response
11/17/05	2.5	Confer with potential class representatives
11/25/05	5.0	Draft motion for preliminary injunction
11/27/05	8.0	Continue drafting motion for preliminary injunction
		and supporting documents
11/28/05	8.0	Review and revise motion for preliminary injunction
11/29/05	8.0	Revise Memorandum of Points and Authorities in
		support of motion for preliminary injunction; revise
		ltt opposing counsel re security breach; confer with
		co-counsel re same
11/30/05	8.0.	Revise Memorandum of Points and Authorities in
		support of motion for preliminary injunction; revise
		ltt opposing counsel re security breach; confer with
		co-counsel re same
12/1/05	8.0	Revise Memorandum of Points and Authorities in
		support of motion for preliminary injunction; confer
		with co-counsel re same; Field media calls re lawsuit;
		review documents filed in related cases
12/2/05	2.5	Confer with OPC re; security breach; confer with co-
		counsel re same and evidence needed for motion for
		preliminary injunction
12/3/05	3.5	Revise Memorandum of Points and Authorities in
		support of motion for preliminary injunction; confer
		with co-counsel re same, draft application in support
		of temporary restraining order; review and draft
		correspondence re same
12/4//05	7.8	Revise Memorandum of Points and Authorities in
		support of motion for preliminary injunction; confer
		with co-counsel re same, continue drafting
		application in support of temporary restraining order;
		review and draft correspondence re same
12/5/05	5.0	Review and revise temporary restraining order

12/6/05	4	Field media calls re security vulnerability; confer with co-counsel re same and next steps
12/7/05	2	Confer with co-counsel re security vulnerability and next steps; Revise Memorandum of Points and Authorities in support of motion for preliminary injunction
12/8/05	7	Review and revise PI motion and supplemental docs; Telephone calls to and from call members re: lawsuit; Telephone call to Bruce Schneier
12/10/05	1	Correspondence with co-counsel re next steps; Confer with Bruce Schneier
12/12/05	1.5	Correspondence with co-counsel re next steps; Confer with Bruce Schneier
12/13/05	4.2	Review draft settlement agreement received from Girard Gibbs; confer re same
12/14/05	6.5	Telephone calls to and from opposing counsel; confer with co-counsel re same
12/15/05	6	Confer with Bruce Schneier re: new developments; preparation for settlement talks
12/16/05	8	Confer with Bruce Schneier re: new developments; preparation for settlement talks; confer with counsel in related cases
12/17/05	8.5	Travel to New York City for settlement talks; preparation for settlement talks
12/18/05	14	Confer with opposing counsel re settlement
12/19/05	7.5	Draft summary of settlement discussions; summarize time spent on case; confer with co-counsel re developments
12/20/05	10	Travel from New York City; confer with co-counsel re settlement discussions; confer with class representatives re: settlement
12/21/05	8	Confer with Federal Trade Commission Representative re MediaMax issues and settlement; Review Preliminary approval documents; Confer with class representatives re: settlement
12/22/05	4.0	Confer with Texas attorney general re: MediaMax issues and settlement; Review Preliminary approval documents; correspondence re same and uninstaller; confer with co-counsel re same
12/23/05	6.5	Review revisions to settlement agreement; correspondence with co-counsel re same; correspondence with class representatives re samde
12/24/05	2.0	Confer with class representatives re: settlement revisions; confer with confer with co-counsel re same
12/26/05	3.0	Correspondence with co-counsel re strategy and settlement revisions; review settlement revisions

12/28/05	2.7	Confer with co-counsel re strategy and settlement revisions; confer re press strategy
1/3/06	3.0	Draft designation agreement
1/4/06	5.0	Preparation for and Confer with Florida Attorney General's office re: case and settlement; draft FAQ re: settlement
1/06/06	5.0	Confer re settlement hearing; review and revise FAQ re settlement
1/8/06	2.5	Respond to class member queries re: settlement; respond to media queries re settlement
1/10/06	2.5	Confer with opposing counsel re FAQ re settlement
1/12/06	7.5	Research, draft and revise outline of small claim process for class members that choose to opt out
1/30/06	3.0	Confer with co-counsel re fee issues; review correspondence re notice
1/31/06	6.0	Review filed stipulation amending settlement agreement; review correspondence tp and from cocounsel re same; review correspondence to and from opposing counsel re same; confer with cocounsel re fee issues
2/1/06	4.0	Confer with cocounsel re stipulated amendment
2/2/06	6.0	Confer re: fee expert; review correspondence to court re stipulated amendment and confer with cocounsel re same; review correspondence re notice issues and stipulated amendment
2/3/06	5.0	Confer with cocounsel re: Stipulated amendment; review correspondence to court from class counsel re stipulated amendment; review correspondence re: same
2/4./06	4.0	Confer with opposing counsel re: stipulated amendment; confer with class representatives re same; review correspondence re same
2/6/05	3	Draft letter to Class Counsel re: designation agreement; review and revise same
2/8/05	1.0	Review settlement notice documents and correspondence re same
2/13/05	1.0	Review correspondence from class counsel; confer re same
2/14	1	Confer re: designation issues
2/16/05	1.0	Confer re alternative forms of settlement notice
2/20/05	.8	Confer with co counsel re: rescheduling meeting re designation; review corr from pritzker
2/21/05	.8	Confer re alternate forms of settlement notice
2/22/05	.8	Confer re gaps in settlement website
2/27	4	Preparation for and meeting with Class Counsel re designation; confer re same

3/1/05	.5	Confer with co counsel re fee application
3/5/05	4.0	Confer with co-counsel re fee application; telephone
		calls to and from experts re same; draft chronology of
		time spent on case
3/7/05	.5	Review correspondence to and from class counsel
3/13/05	2.0	Summarize time spent on case
Corynne TOTAL	271.1	

SONY TIME-Fred von Lohmann

DATE	TIME	WORK PERFORMED
11/8/05	5.0	Initial research re XCP; reviewing EULA terms;
		examining XCP discs; call with A. Halderman re
		XCP and MediaMax
11/9/05	1.0	Call with R. Green
11/15/05	1.0	Call with J. Cunnard; consult with C. McSherry, R.
		Green; call with D. Kaminsky re XCP DNS research
11/16/05	1.0	Call with J. Cunnard, R. Green; consult with EFF
		team re strategy
11/17/05	2.0	Drafting letter to J. Cunnard; review and revise draft
		complaint
11/18/05	0.5	Call with J. Cunnard; call with R. Green
11/28/05	1.5	Call with R. Green, A. Sharma re remedies,
		injunctive relief
12/5/05	1.0	Call with J. Cunnard; call with cocounsel re Sony-
		BMG letter; reviewing letter to J. Cunnard
TOTAL Fred	13	

SONY TIME-Jason Schultz

DATE	TIME	WORK PERFORMED
11/14/05	1.5	Review case file, including security research and
		complaints New York and Chicago complaints;
		Review Sony EULA.
11/17/05	1.0	Review and comment on draft correspondence
		w/Sony
11/19/05	0.5	Review and respond to team email; attend strategy
		session.
11/21/05	0.5	Final comments on complaint
11/22/05	1.5	Speaking to press about suit and class injury
11/27/05	4.0	Research re: First4Internet and MediaMax
12/05/05	0.5	Review uninstaller EULA
12/07/05	1.0	Correspond with team re: mediamax vulnerability
12/24/05	0.5	Review and respond to team emails
12/26/05	2.0	Prep for and participate in team conference call
1/03/06	2.0	Review FAQ
3/16/06	1.0	Review Sony letter re: trademark use
3/27/05	1.0	Summarize time spent on case
Jason Total	17	

Sony Time: Allison Navone, Paralegal

October 31	1.5	review emails and members' concerns regarding blog
November 1	2.0	meet with legal team to discuss intake messages regarding Sony Rootkit program and blog post and potential action.
November 7	3.0	continue responding to inquiries regarding EFF's action against Sony.
November 8	7.5	compile information from prospective class action representatives.
November 9	7.0	compile information. Respond to inquiries reqarding suit. Direct press calls to appropriate staff members.
November 10	3.0	Continue responding to potential clients and general email/phone inquiries regarding the Sony rootkit. Compile information regarding individual's experiences with the program.
November 11	6.0	Disseminate information regarding the program and infected CDs to enquirers.
November 14	1.5	Gather data and information from potential clients and pass on to lawyers.
November 15	1.0	Field requests from EFF members, potential clients, interested attorneys and media.
November 16	2.5	Compile data on customers' experiences with XCP.
November 17	1.0	Respond to member and community inquiries regarding EFF's suit, SunComm and XCP. Record information

		regarding CD titles and
		individuals' experiences
		with the DRM.
November 18	0.5	Continue responding to
		emails and messages about
		Sony and the class action
		suit.
November 21	1.5	Continue gathering
		information about
		SunComm/MediaMax
		customers. Respond to
		usual inquiries regarding
		the suit and the Sony BMG
		DRM
November 22	1.5	Respond to inquiries
		regarding EFF's suit.
December 7	1.5	Respond to and thank EFF
		members who contacted CA
		Attorney General regarding
		Sony Rootkit.
December 22	2.5	Search responses from
		potential clients by state and
		forward contact information
		upon receiving approval to
		do so.
January 4	3.0	Disuss settlement terms
		with EFF attorneys and
		respond to calls and emails
		regarding initial settlement
T 10	1.0	terms.
January 10	1.0	Respond to several inquiries
		regarding availability of
T 12	2.0	DRM'd cd's
January 13	2.0	Respond to inquiries
		regarding settlement terms
		and availability of DRM cd's.
January 24	.25	
January 24	.43	Respond to inquiries regarding access to
		settlement benefits.
Allison Navone Total	49.75	Settlement benefits.
Amson Navone Total	47.73	

DETAILED TIME RECORDS OF KURT OPSAHL

Date	Hours	Description
11/7/2005	1.25	Research and analysis of trespass to chattel claim
11/8/2005	1.50	Analysis of possible CFAA claim, Legalteam meeting re analysis of
11/9/2005	1.00	Draft email memo re CFAA claim
		Analysis legal issues regarding sony update, uninstall and privacy
11/10/2005	2.75	policy, review and analysis of Sony EULA
		Analysis of Sony causes of action, and Calif Computer crime, review
11/11/2005	2.50	and revise open letter, strategy analysis
		research CLRA and Spyware, Trespass to Chattel, review and analysis
11/12/2005	5.25	of Sony EULA
11/13/2005	2.25	review and revise complaint
11/14/2005	2.50	Analysis of strategy for causes of action, review and revise complaint
11/15/2005	3.00	Call with Sony re efforts to resolve
11/16/2005	4.25	Confer with Sony on efforts to resolve, develop issues to take up, CFAA
11/17/2005	5.50	Develop SunnComm facts for complaint, CFAA public safety argument
11/18/2005	7.25	review and revise complaint, analysis of Sony response
11/19/2005	2.75	SunnComm facts for complaint, analysis of MM software, analysis of
11/20/2005	5.25	Review and analysis of complaint, potential security issue
		Confer with expert re security analysis, revise text on Sony page. MM
11/21/2005	6.75	factual development
		Formalize expert retainer, prepare for TX Ag call, review cust svc
11/22/2005		responses, analysis of copyright issues
11/23/2005		Call with TX AG, factual development on DRM
11/24/2005		Review SoundScan numbers on effected discs. Analysis of expert
11/28/2005	2.25	Analysis of security issues with MM5
		Review expert report on security issue, draft email to Sony, analysis of
11/29/2005	6.25	MM strategy
		Prepare for negotiations with Sony regarding MediaMax security
11/30/2005		vulnerability response
12/1/2005		MediaMax response, call with Sony, revise complaint
12/2/2005		Analysis of MM response, research experts
12/3/2005		Work with Sony regarding response vis-à-vis MM5
12/4/2005		Conference calls with Sony regarding MM response
12/5/2005		Work with Sony regarding response vis-à-vis MM5
12/6/2005		Work with Sony regarding response vis-à-vis MM5
12/7/2005		Call with Pritzker, settlement analysis, study on spyware, MM security
12/8/2005	7.75	All day conference calls. Sony in the morning, plaintiffs counsel

12/19/2005	2.75 Analysis of Settlement/CMC; MM CDs technical
12/20/2005	3.25 Analysis of Settlement/CMC, MDL; Review mediamax Cds patch
	Review and analysis of banner text; Confer with FTC re lawsuit; Review
12/21/2005	5.50 Texas action; review MM cds re uninstaller problems
12/22/2005	4.75 Analysis of anti-spyware, disclosure, uninstaller issues; draft email to
12/24/2005	0.75 Review draft compromise language
12/25/2005	1.25 Analysis of settlement issues
12/26/2005	3.25 Analysis of settlement issues
12/27/2005	1.25 Analysis of settlement issues
12/29/2005	1.50 Review and revise press in support of settlement
12/30/2005	1.25 Confer with Illinois AG office
1/1/2006	0.50 Confer with expert re security analysis; review FL Ag action
1/3/2006	4.75 Prepare for Sony hearing; review list of effected discs
1/4/2006	5.00 Prepare for Sony hearing; comment on banners
1/5/2006	10.50 Prepare for Sony hearing; FAQ; Banners; travel to NYC
1/6/2006	8.50 Meeting with Sony; Prepare for hearing; Hearing; FAQs; press
1/7/2006	8.00 Travel from NYC; follow up from Sony meeting
1/8/2006	1.25 FAQs; Anti-cirus/spyware sfotware
1/9/2006	1.00 Analysis of texas AG communnications
1/10/2006	2.75 Sony calander; Review and analysis of notice campaign
1/11/2006	3.00 Conference call re MM issues; Analysis of FAQ issues
1/12/2006	1.25 Analysis of DRM security issues; Review proposed changes to FAQs
1/13/2006	0.25 Analysis of delegation agreement issues
1/16/2006	0.50 Analysis of scope of XCP problem
1/17/2006	2.75 Letter to Sony re Full Form Notice
1/18/2006	1 Finalize and send letter re full form notice
1/19/2006	1.25 Review and revise banners
1/26/2006	2 Draft responsive email re Sony DRM
1/31/2006	2.25 Analyais of Sony changes to settlement
2/1/2006	1.75 Analysis of response to Sony changes to settlement
2/2/2006	2.25 Call with Sony re notice issues
2/3/2006	5.25 Analysis of post-expiration valuation issue; loyalty program law; anti-
2/6/2006	1.5 Analysis of response to Sony changes to settlement
2/7/2006	4.5 Analysis of draft motion and proposed order; review settlement
2/8/2006	4.25 Analysis of banners; email to Sony re Settlement Website
2/10/2006	0.75 Analysis of designation issue4s
2/13/2006	0.5 Analysis of deligation dispute
2/16/2006	2 Analysis of how to increase uptake of settlement, Sony notice
2/20/2006	1.5 Strategy meeting; Review and edit email corespondance

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page

e

	Selection Crite	ria			
Client (han	d select) Include: Sony Rootkit				
Nickname Full Name In Ref To	Sony Rootkit 479				
Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
11/18/2005	ST	295.00	3.60	1,062.00	Billable
11/21/2005	Spoke to Mary Schumacher, re: experience w/Sony CD; dra conducted internet research.	aft and send retair 295.00	ner letter;	442.50	Billable
1 1/2 1/2005	51	295.00	1.50	442.50	billable
11/22/2005	Review Complaint REW	325.00	0.50	162.50	Billable
11/22/2005	Discussion with LEF, re: email, question of tort and cause LEF	s of action. 495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
11/22/2005	Discussion with REW, re: email, question of tort and caus LEF	es of action. 495.00	1.50	742.50	Billable
11/23/2005	Review Cindy Cohn's email to Robt, Green, Reed of Lerack Preliminary Injunction, Experts, etc. LEF	n Office, re: NY fili 495.00	ng, 0.10	49.50	Billable
	Forwarded email to Cindy Cohn regarding security issues	and compromisir	ng of		
11/23/2005	networks.	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
11/23/2005	Forwarded email to K. Opsahl regarding Rootkit article on LEF	Dmusic website. 495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
	Forwarded email to SGT of rought draft of NY Complaint se	ent by Avin Sharm	a;		
11/23/2005	discussion of same. ST	295.00	0.25	73.75	Billable
11/23/2005	Diiscussion with LEF of rought draft of NY Complaint sent LEF	by Avin Sharma. 495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
11/23/2005	Forwarded email to of article regarding security force ST	es giving analysis 295.00	of EULA 1.50	442.50	Billable
11/24/2005	Review Complaint and emails. LEF	495.00	0.25	123.75	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to K. Opsahl questioning expert is enough.	whether one test	monial		
11/28/2005		295.00	3.00	885.00	Billable
	D : 0 1 1 1 1 1				

Review Complaint and Emails.

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page

2

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
11/28/2005		495.00	0.25	123.75	Billable
11/28/2005	Reviewed email from J. Schulz, SGT and J. Tyre, re: recall. LEF	495.00	0.17	82.50	Billable
11/28/2005	Reviewed email from J. Schulz, re: Disc. of SD files. LEF	495.00	0.25	123.75	Billable
11/28/2005	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl and SGT, re: Titles of Canadia LEF	n plaintiffs. 495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to SGT requesting that he che	ck Canadian	Titles		
11/28/2005	(Sunn Comm XCP). LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
11/29/2005	Composed and forwarded email to K. Opsahl, re: checking Titl LEF	es of CDs. 495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to Sharma informing him that	Spitzer is loo	king into		
11/29/2005	phony recall. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
11/29/2005	Forwarded email to SGT, re: another draft of NY Complaint from LEF	m Sharma. 495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
11/29/2005	Reviewed email from Robert Green discussing potential secur LEF	ity issue. 495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
11/29/2005	Reviewed Response of R. Kathrein, re: Owners of Root Kit Cla	ss Definition 495.00	0.70	346.50	Billable
11/29/2005	Reviewed draft changes from Kurt Opsahl. LEF	495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
11/29/2005	Reviewed emails from A P. Sharma, re: recall and complaint. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
11/29/2005	Reviewed email from Corynne McSherry, re: security risks. LEF	495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to Kathrein, re: all owners of	computers w	th rootkits		
11/29/2005	are defined in the Class Action Definition.	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
11/30/2005	Reviewed email to J. Schultz, re: Secret Recalls.	295.00	3.00	885.00	Billable
12/1/2005	Review NY Complaint. ST	295.00	1.50	442.50	Billable
	Review email; speak to Sharma; draft email to client.				

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page

3

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
12/1/2005		495.00	1.00	495.00	Billable
12/1/2005	Reviewed email to SGT, re: NY Complaint draft with attachmen LEF	ts. 495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
12/2/2005	Reviewed email to Sherry, re: Copyright Act Fee Shift. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
12/2/2005	Forwarded email to SGT, re: completed copy of NY Complaint. LEF	495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
12/2/2005	Composed and forwarded email to C. Cohn describing the Fee Beastie Boys v. James Newton.	Shift Act and	l citing 5.00	1,475.00	Billable
12/2/2005	Review draft complaint; research, re: def. of class.	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to C. Cohn asking to add REV	Vto Listserv,	citing her		
12/2/2005	expertise in this matter.	325.00	0.50	162.50	Billable
12/2/2005	Reviewed draft of TRO memo. LEF	495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to C. McSherry citing the impo	rtance of Cop	yright Sct		
12/5/2005	Fee Shift LEF	495.00	0.75	371.25	Billable
12/5/2005	Discussion with C. Cohn, re: EULA Protection and other Copyr LEF	ight protectio 495.00	n. 0.20	99.00	Billable
12/5/2005	Reviewed email from Fred Von Lohman, re: article relating to X LEF	CP software 495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
	Reviewed draft electronic letter from Robert Green and J. Cuna	rd from C. Co	ohn		
12/5/2005	outlining issues for settlement. LEF	495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
	Reviewed C. Cohn's redlined version of R. Green's letter above	regarding hi	s demands		
12/5/2005	(3 page letter). LEF	495.00	0.60	297.00	Billable
12/5/2005	Reviewed email from R. Kathrein, re: draft letter to Sony, forwar LEF	rded same to 495.00	REW. 0.40	198.00	Billable
12/5/2005	Reviewed Sony's software update forwarded by C. Cohn. LEF	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
12/5/2005	Reviewed Sony's software update forwarded by C. Cohn. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed letter to Kurt Opsahl, re: security flaw in Sony/BIG CE	os (Joint Pres	ss Release)		

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page

Sony Rootkit: (continued)

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
12/6/2005	LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
12/6/2005	Read and reviewed email from Avin Sharma. LEF	495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
12/6/2005	Received okay from Robert Green to Press Release Update agreement from C. Cohn and A Sharma. LEF	with changes a 495.00	nd 0.50	247.50	Billable
12/6/2005	Received okay from Robert Green to Press Release Update agreement from C. Cohn and A Sharma. LEF	with changes a	nd 0.60	297.00	Billable
12/6/2005	Reviewed outline of SunnComm's Security Update received for		0.40	198.00	Billable
12/6/2005	Reviewed emails from C. Cohn and J. Friedman, re: Injunction compensation.	ve Reliefand 495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
12/0/2003	Composed and forwarded emails to K. Opsahl, S. Scarlett an Mediamax & XCP.			247.50	billable
12/6/2005		495.00	0.60	297.00	Billable
12/6/2005	Reviewed email from C. Cohn, re: Independent Audit and res LEF	sponded thereto 495.00	o. 0.50	247.50	Billable
12/6/2005	Composed and forwarded email to McSherry, re: class wide individualized and do not predominate.	damages are t	wo 0.50	247.50	Billable
12/6/2005	Reviewed S. Scarlett revisions to draft letter (Confidential).	495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
12/6/2005	Reviewed NY Times article, re: Buy, Play, Repeat, sent to Jas LEF	son Shultz 495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to SGT sending letter to Curegarding efforts to settle.		, ,		
12/6/2005	LEF	495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
12/6/2005	Composed and forwarded email to REW sending draft letter on Cunnard's letter and response. LEF	to Team Sony of 495.00	commenting 0.50	247.50	Billable
12/6/2005	Composed and forwarded email to REW sending letter from Cohn and Robert Green, "Confidential", For Settlement Purpo LEF		0.50	247.50	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to K. Opsahl from Dmusic f	orum. re: "whe	re did half		

Composed and forwarded email to K. Opsahl from Dmusic forum, re: "where did half million hits to Sony's website in DNS caches come from"; does such DNS evidence exist?

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page

e 5

Date	User	Rate	Hours	Amount	Total
Date	Task	Markup %	DNB Time	DNB Amt	TOLEI
12/6/2005	LEF	495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
12/6/2005	Reviewed S. Scarlett and Jeff Friedman's edits and sugges LEF	tions to Kathrein' 495.00	s letter. 0.50	247.50	Billable
12/6/2005	Reviewed article published by Bonnie Snoutinroff. LEF	495.00	1.00	495.00	Billable
12/7/2005	Conference call with Team Sony, re: Class Action. LEF	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
12/7/2005	Reviewed email regarding Robert Rothman's response to b	nis private call wi 495.00	th Jeff. 0.30	148.50	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to K. Opsahl, re: "who is o	hief litigator if no	t Jeff at		
12/7/2005	Sony?". LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
12/7/2005	Reviewed email from A Sharma forwarding Order from L.A LEF	Superior Court. 495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
12/7/2005	Reviewed email from A Sharma forwarding Order from L.A LEF	Superior Court. 495.00	0.60	297.00	Billable
	Emailed discussion of C. Cohn, A Sharma and K. Opsahl r	egarding Federa	l Complaint		
12/7/2005	(Sunn Comm). LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
12/7/2005	Composed and forwarded email to Opsahl, re: spyware an LEF	d antivirus protec 495.00	otion. 0.50	247.50	Billable
	Reviewed notes regarding call between Opsahl and Elizabe	eth Pritzker, re: d	iscussion		
12/7/2005	about NY deal. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn regarding arrangements for	conference call v	vith Pritzker		
12/7/2005	and Robert Green and K. Opsahl. LEF	495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
12/7/2005	Reviewed email from REW commenting on response to cla LEF	ass certification. 495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
12/7/2005	Reviewed email from R. Kathrein, re: Felten's findings. LEF	495.00	0.70	346.50	Billable
12/7/2005	Reviewed emails regarding details of call between J. Cuna comments from J. Friedman, K. Opsahl, Robert Green and LEF		vith 0.40	198.00	Billable
12/7/2005	Reviewed email from Sharma, re: potential plaintiff and R. LEF	Kathrein's respoi 495.00	nse thereto. 0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from Sharma, re: Foxtrot cartoon.				

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page

6

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
12/7/2005	LEF	495.00	1.00	495.00	Billable
12/7/2005	Reviewed notes from Sony's group discussion with Ed Felten. LEF	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn, K. Opsahl, A Stamos and R. Ka	threin, re: ch	anges in		
12/8/2005	course of action. LEF	495.00	1.30	643.50	Billable
12/8/2005	Reviewed email from A Sharma with attached ND Cal. Compla LEF	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from S. Scarlett to Opsahl, R. Green and A Sha	arma remind	ing all of LA		
12/8/2005	Order and PI Strategy. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email to Sharma, Opsahl and Scarlett, re: deadline f	or filing ND C	Cal.		
12/8/2005	Complaint. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
12/8/2005	Reviewed email from Robert Green, re: conference call. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
12/8/2005	Reviewed email from Opsahl and Green, re: efforts to set up α LEF	onference cal 495.00	II. 0.40	198.00	Billable
12/8/2005	Reviewed email from Opsahl regarding his notes to team about LEF	ut his call to J 495.00	. Cunard. 0.40	198.00	Billable
12/8/2005	Reviewed email from Opsahl regarding his notes to team about LEF	ut his call to J 495.00	. Cunard. 0.40	198.00	Billable
12/8/2005	Composed and forwarded email to McSherry regarding J. Fried LEF	lman. 495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from Opsahl regarding forwarding his notes to	Cunard and	R. Green		
12/8/2005	about his call to J. Cunard. ST	295.00	0.50	147.50	Billable
12/8/2005	Review emails. LEF	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
12/8/2005	Reviewed email outline of letter of R. Green to J. Buchwald, re: LEF	dual settlem 495.00	ent. 0.50	247.50	Billable
12/9/2005	Reviewed various emails from C. Cohn, re: Mediamax and set LEF	tlement draft. 495.00	1.00	495.00	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to C. Cohn regarding class ac	ction culture;	discussion		
12/9/2005	of how to handle fees	295.00	1.20	354.00	Billable
	Review emails.				

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page

Sony Rootkit: (continued)

	(•••••••••				
Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
12/10/2005		495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn, re: her redlined version/changes Buchwald.		•		
12/10/2005	LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
12/11/2005	Composed and forwarded email to C. Cohn asking when letter is LEF	s going out. 495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
12/11/2005	Reviewed J. Freidman's email commenting on MDL letter of Rob LEF	ert Green. 495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
12/11/2005	Reviewed Charles Baker's request to R. Green, re: attachments LEF	to complain 495.00	ot. 0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from McSherry noting that Jury trial was not dem	anded in So	onys		
12/11/2005	Complaint but was demanded in California's Complaint. LEF	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
12/11/2005	Reviewed email to Shana, re: suggested MDL edits. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
12/11/2005	Composed and forwarded email to J. Friedman, re: letter to $\cos \omega$ LEF	rt. 495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from R. Green, re: his comments on changes to	o letter to co	urt (also		
12/12/2005	sent to Kathrein and J. Friedman). LEF	495.00	0.70	346.50	Billable
12/12/2005	Reviewed emails forwarded by R. Kathrein regarding CLAIM Cor LEF	mplaint. 495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
12/12/2005	Reviewed Rootkit's sut in papers; awaiting Texas information. LEF	495.00	0.70	346.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from Tracy Feldman, re: Sony releasing Spywar	re (intention	ally or		
12/12/2005	accidentally) and responded to same. LEF	495.00	0.60	297.00	Billable
12/12/2005	Composed and forwarded email to C. Cohn with possible responser	enses to Prit 495.00	zker. 0.40	198.00	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to Dmusic commenting that CD	Os are still w	ulnerable to		
12/12/2005	spyware despite patches. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to C. Cohn informing her that w	e are getting	g in touch		
12/12/2005	with the Canadian plaintiffs. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to C. Cohn and R. Rothman, re	: "I would a	opreciate		

being included in 'we are co-counsel for the plaintiffs' ".

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 8

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
12/12/2005	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
40/40/0005	Composed and forwarded email to J. Friedman, re: "are you as Feldman be on the Executive Committee on Order?".			707.50	DW Ma
12/12/2005	ST	295.00	2.50	737.50	Billable
12/13/2005	Review emails; search for Canadian Plaintiff. LEF	495.00	1.00	495.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn forwarding working copy of Draff	t Settlement A	greement		
12/13/2005	sent to her by E. Pritzker. LEF	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl's comments, re: Settlement A	greement and	d Mediamax		
12/13/2005	Plaintiffs. LEF	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Reviewed emails from Friedman, Green, McSherry and Rothman	an relating to	Mexico		
12/13/2005	TRO and Decision. LEF	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Read and reviewed email from K. Opsahl forwarding letter from	n Bruce Kelle	r, re: Sony's		
12/13/2005	continuing position to review its business practices. LEF	495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
12/13/2005	Read and reviewed email discussion of inability to file MDL par LEF	pers. 495.00	0.80	396.00	Billable
12/13/2005	Read email forwarded by Robert Green attaching Settlement. LEF	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
12/13/2005	Read Cindy Cohn's email regarding discussion of revised Med LEF	diamaxfiling. 495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Read email from Fred VonLehman of warning by Chief Administratives of Representatives, advising members not to play Sony				
12/13/2005	computers. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
12/14/2005	Reviewed email from Kathrein forwarding letter to Judge Bucht LEF	wald. 495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
12/14/2005	Email discussion of when to have conference call with Rothma	an, Sharma ai 495.00	nd McSherry. 0.40	198.00	Billable
12/14/2005	Reviewed email from Jason Schultz, re: discussion of House warning of use of Sony CDs.	of Representa	atives' 0.50	247.50	Billable
12/17/2000		430.00	0.50	247.50	Dillable
	Email discussion of conference set for February 17th.				

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 9

Sony Rootkit: (continued)

Date	User Task	Rate M arkup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
12/15/2005	LEF	495.00	1.00	495.00	Billable
	Research, re: Incidental Use; reviewed email from MQ regard	ding new Sony	Plaintiff		
12/15/2005	(attomey from NC). LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Review email from C. Cohn to R. Green and J. Friedman forw received from Elizabeth Pritzker.	arding messag	ge she		
12/15/2005		495.00	0.70	346.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl, re: call received from FTC reinformation on Mediamax and global settlement.	egarding furthe	r		
12/15/2005		495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
	Reviewed emal from Sharma highlighting points of conference file for MDL next week, et. al.	ce call, i.e., Son	y intends to		
12/15/2005		495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
12/16/2005	Composed and forwarded email to C. Cohn, re: latest Anti-Se LEF	ony move from 495.00	MS. 0.50	247.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from Sharma discussing conference call with highlights of discussion, i.e., Sony intention to file MDL next w		nsel and		
12/16/2005	•	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
12/16/2005	Reviewed email from Green, re: discussion of conference ca LEF	all for today. 495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. McSherry informing all that FTC control of Sunn Comm EAC.	acted her reque	esting a		
12/16/2005	copy of Sunn Comm FAQ. LEF	495.00	0.60	297.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn forwarding documents - Final	Order and Preli	minary		
12/16/2005	Approval. LEF	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
12/18/2005	Reviewed email from C. Cohn forwarding two settlement term LEF	n additions. 495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
12/19/2005	Reviewed email from Von Lehmann noting article regarding S LEF	Sony suits. 495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Review email from C. Cohn to Elizabeth and Scott regarding of advise of settlement.	calling Court Cl	erk to		
12/19/2005		495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
12/19/2005	Reviewed email from R. Green regarding forwarding two stips REW	ulation docume 325.00	ents. 0.50	162.50	Billable
	B 11-B1 11 11 12 12 12 12 1				

Read MDL Motion and Order of CA court.

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 10

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
12/19/2005	LEF	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn regarding forwarding two initiale and EFF.	d settlement			
12/19/2005	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
12/19/2005	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl regarding Soundscan Access. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn regarding attempt to get valuation	n figure for M	lediamax		
12/19/2005	relief. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Review email from K. Opsahl to R. Green regarding discussion	of conference	ce call for		
12/19/2005	December 19, 2005. ST	295.00	1.50	442.50	Billable
12/19/2005	Review emails and Settlement Agreement LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Review email from K. Opsahl regarding conversation with Sour	dscan about	CD		
12/19/2005	sales/full access or one time use. LEF	495.00	0.80	396.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from McSherry forwarding two settlement docu what we wanted.	ments, notin	g we did get		
12/19/2005	LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn (Pritzker), re: Sony wants to call and Sony agrees to extend date for us to object to CMC again.	courts regard	ding CMC		
12/19/2005	, -	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
12/19/2005	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to Bruce Keller thanking him for a LEF	a productive 495.00	meeting. 0.80	396.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn forwarding Final Settlement Agre	ement			
12/19/2005	LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
12/19/2005	Reviewed email from C. Cohn forwarding Sony artists to downlo	oad. 495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn acknowledging agreement of pa	rties by initia	ling		
12/20/2005	document, time deadline, 11:00 p.m. EST. LEF	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn regarding letter to Elizabeth Pritz	ker and Scot	discussing		
12/20/2005	CMC and draft notice is being prepared. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to Sony regarding designee/side	agreement.			

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 11

Sony Rootkit: (continued)

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
12/20/2005	LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from Robert Green response to C. Cohn's emand discussion of granting extension of time.		·		
12/20/2005	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
12/20/2005	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to E. Pritzker asking when we ca LEF	n expect doc 495.00	uments. 0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed K. Opsahl's email attaching correspondence regardi Comm's tech support; J. Friedman replied that he was not able wanted to make sure other parties were notified.				
12/21/2005		495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to various reg now; being sent cc on agreed upon documents; when to start d date of January 6, 2006(?).	arding steps Iraft motion a			
12/21/2005		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to SGT regarding sending Set Notice.	ttlement Agre	ement and		
12/21/2005	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to McSherry asking if anyone licients.				
12/21/2005	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
12/21/2005	Reviewed email from C. McSherry forwarding notice regarding LEF	Claim Submi 495.00	ssion. 0.20	99.00	Billable
12/21/2005	Reviewed C. Cohn's email forwarding notice and summary not LEF	ice. 495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to Assistant Attorney General, Pa	aul Singer reg	arding		
12/21/2005	removing Mediamax from stores. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. McSherry regarding Sunn Comm to ma	ake security ι	ıpdate		
12/21/2005	available to address recently discovered vulnerability. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
10/01/0005	Reviewed email from C. Cohn regarding forwarding message of General, Paul Singer, re: amended lawsuit.		·		D
12/21/2005	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
12/22/2005	Reviewed C. Cohn's email regarding forwarding proposed ban LEF	ner. 495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable

Reviewed email from J. Friedman suggesting we say downloads will not be accompanied by offending software; C. Cohn emailed acknowledging that we will comply with this suggestion.

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 12

Sony Rootkit: (continued)

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
12/22/2005	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
12/22/2005	Reviewed email from J. Friedman regarding discussion of Me LEF	diaMaxInstalle 495.00	er problem. 0.10	49.50	Billable
12/22/2005	Reviewed email from James Tyre regarding attaching Kurt's F LEF	PDF file. 495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from McSherry to E. Pritzker regarding forward and C. Cohn's comments redlined.	-			
12/22/2005	LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
40/00/005	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl to E. Pritzker regarding forwar correspondence with Sunn Comm's technical problems with	uninstaller for l	Mediamax 5.	40.50	Dillalda
12/22/2005	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. McSherry asking if anybody knows Ba from Massachusetts, who called Fred claiming to have filed a	gainst Sony the	ere.		
12/22/2005	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from Robert Green responding to Altman's fir a PI firm with four attorneys; McSherry's email states she think Wilmington, MA				
12/22/2005	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from McSherry noting she spoke with Mr. Altri involved with resolution of case and be paid for his time; advis courtesy that he should not expend much more time on the ca	ed him as a p			
12/22/2005	-	295.00	2.00	590.00	Billable
12/22/2005	Review Settlement Agreement and Notice REW	325.00	1.00	325.00	Billable
12/23/2005	Read through settlement documents. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed CD from Jason Schultz noting Sony still selling XCI stores.	Rootkits in So	ony style		
12/23/2005	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn regarding attaching most curre Agreement and intention of filing on the 24th.	nt version of S	ettlement		
12/23/2005	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn regarding call from Aaron and Mexico TRO prevents entry into settlement until Wednesday of	next week.			
12/23/2005	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
12/23/2005	Reviewed email from Jenelle. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn regarding current draft of Settle	ment Agreeme	ent and		

Reviewed email from C. Cohn regarding current draft of Settlement Agreement and redline version.

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 13

Sony Rootkit: (continued)

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
12/23/2005	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn regarding MDL Motion to Trans	fer federal cas	es to SDNY		
12/23/2005	ifthat's okay. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from Corynne McSherry commenting on redliand would like to get back to Pritzker asap.	ne version of A	greement		
12/23/2005	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
12/24/2005	Reviewed email regarding Robert Green's okay - asking Jeff LEF	Jacobsen to ge 495.00	et it done. 0.30	148.50	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to K. Opsahl advising him to	get as many o	lisclaimers		
12/24/2005	during delay of New Mexico injunction. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn regarding forwarding Jeff Cunr		ion for		
12/24/2005	compromised language addressing two points in the EULAV LEF	Vaiver. 495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from Kurt Opsahl regarding discussed sugge	ested languag	e should		
2/24/2005	not be included in final agreement. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to Jason Schultz discussing	jurisdiction ov	er		
2/25/2005	non-parties in a Class Action Settlement. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn stating she did not agree to sig	gn agreement i	n the form		
2/25/2005	circulated. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Read and reviewed email from Kurt Opsahl regarding evaluation to inform the model of the control	tion of C. Cohn	's concerns		
12/25/2005	relative to informing the public of agreement. LEF	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn outlining what she believes to	be the current	version of		
12/25/2005	the settlement agreement in response to Jeff Cunnard. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn requesting conference call to oproblems of agreement; responses and agreements from C. J. Friedman.				
12/26/2005		495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn regarding forwarding E. Pritzke	er's form of the	settlement		
2/26/2005	agreement. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. McSherry giving her opinion of Sony I	RMG's Settlem	ent		

Reviewed email from C. McSherry giving her opinion of Sony BMG's Settlement Agreement (noting no valuations).

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 14

Sony Rootkit: (continued)

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
12/26/2005		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl regarding discussion of C. Col whether to withdraw from settlement or request Injunctive Relief	f.			
12/26/2005	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from Jenelle Welling requesting copy of E. Pritagreement.				
12/27/2005	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from Jenelle Welling to EFF regarding forward	ing copy of s	ettlement		
12/27/2005	agreement. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl forwarding redlined additions of	comparing C	Gand EFFs		
12/27 <i>[</i> 2005	Friday versions. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
12 <i>/</i> 27 <i>/</i> 2005	Reviewed email from C. Cohn regarding forwarding summary n	notices and n 495.00	notices.	49.50	Billable
. 2,21,2000					
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to all (mainly to Jenelle Welling), she is ready to speak with Sony.	regarding th	e ract that		
12/27 <i>[</i> 2005	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn noting agreement of all that docu	ıments are r	eady for		
12/27 <i> </i> 2005	filing. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
12/27 <i>/</i> 2005	Reviewed email from Jenelle Welling regarding new summary	notice and n 495.00	otice.	198.00	Billable
12/21/2003				130.00	Dillabic
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to Jenelle regarding her review of she finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17, "participating in the finds to be non-negotiable (Par.(t)), page 17,				
12/27/2005		495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. McSherry to Jenelle, rejecting several ragreement; Jenelle advising all that her office is closed until Jan				
12/27/2005	as K. Opsahl's. LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl noting that most malls still have on their shelves and are allowed to sell same.	e Sony CDs	with Rootkit		
12 <i>/</i> 27 <i>/</i> 2005		495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email advising "Creative Objecting" agreement	may improve	settlement		
12/27 <i>/</i> 2005	agreement. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to C. Cohn suggesting trying t	to remove tra	demark		

Composed and forwarded email to C. Cohn suggesting trying to remove trademark claims as well as copyright claim.

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 15

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
12/27/2005	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl noting that some items in the as objectionable and up for further discussion.	settlement mu	ust be seen		
12/27/2005	ST	295.00	2.50	737.50	Billable
12/27/2005	Review settement documents and correspondence LEF	495.00	1.00	495.00	Billable
12/28/2005	Telephone conversation with ST	295.00	2.00	590.00	Billable
12/29/2005	Review correspondence and Settlement Agreement LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from J. Schultz, re: response to Cohn regarding	ng Defendants	5		
12/29/2005	Response to Complaint. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn regarding addressing question Objecting" meaning.	ing LEFs use	of "Creative		
12/29/2005	, ,	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from J. Friedman remarking "indefinitely' may pending proceedings" in agreement.	y be changed t	o "stayed		
12/29/2005		495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from McSherry to Sharma questioning a hear January 6, 2006.	ing date previo	ously set for		
12/29/2005		495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
12/29/2005	Reviewed email from C. Cohn forwarding J. Friedman's email LEF	regarding Me 495.00	con. 1.00	495.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from A Sharma regarding forwarding MDL do	ocument (Motic	on for		
12/29/2005	Transfer) Notice due January 3, 2006. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from R. Green to J. Friedman agreeing to ope	en end of time	for		
12/29/2005	Defendants to Respond to Melcon Complaint. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl regarding forwarding newspa	per articles hi	ghlighting		
12/29/2005	Sony Rootkit's Settlement Press Release. LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn responding to Sony DRM Mess	age authorizin	g mailing		
12/29/2005	list posting. REW	325.00	0.75	243.75	Billable
	Read through MDL Motion papers.				

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 16

Sony Rootkit: (continued)

PDF of the MDL filing asap.

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
12/30/2005		495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
12/30/2005	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to Team regarding settlement flawed DRM (with details of Press Release). LEF	of EFF and Sor 495.00	ny over 0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from Kurt Opsahl regarding response to Leg Release and comments including Sony's obligation to restore back to Pre-Rootkit condition.				
12/30/2005	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
4/0/0000	Reviewed email from Seth Johnson regarding forwarding Pre DMCA and others (2348).			40.50	Dillahla
1/2/2006	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
1/2/2006	Composed and forwarded email asking for Friedman's cell p LEF	hone number. 495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn requesting conference call for responses to Friedman's email; recalled Sony was going to regotiations with Kamber; Jenelle Welling, K. Opsahl, McShe for January 3, 2006 conference call (all emails).	ecall XCP befo	re		
1/2/2006		495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to REW, re: conference call 9:30 a.m. PST.	for January 3, 2	2006 at		
1/2/2006	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from J. Friedman regarding discussion with negotiation of fees with him and without Kamber; Jacobson of Cohn call.				
1/2/2006		495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl, re: Fl Attorney General's Offinto false deceptive trade practices by Sony; Sony cooperating	g with investiga	tion.		
1/3/2006	LEF	495.00	1.00	495.00	Billable
1/3/2006	Conference call. LEF	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn regarding continuing discussion interest and suggesting Mr. Hesse be included in these discussion.	ussions.			
1/3/2006	LEF	495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
1/3/2006	Reviewed email from Robert Green to J. Friedman and Shandocuments prepared for MDL (Schedule; Amended P & A; and LEF			49.50	Billable
5.2550				.0.50	
1/3/2006	Reviewed email from J. Friedman to C. McSherry regarding A LEF	Itman demand 495.00	letter. 0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from Jenelle Welling to Jeff and Shana; that	Jacobson wou	ld like a		

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 17

Sony Rootkit: (continued)

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
1/3/2006		495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. McSherry forwarding informannouncement from Amazon.com to those who pure Sony's intended course of action because of security commenting on this course of action by Sony.	chased Sony items from	•		
1/3/2006		495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl noticing nothing on 2006.	the docket for Friday, Jai	nuary 6,		
1/3/2006	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from J. Friedman, re: conversation with us directly, will tell Kamber at appropriate time.	with Jeff that Sony agree	es to deal		
1/3/2006	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from Robert Green to Jacobson attato be filed tomorrow, January 4, 2006.	aching executed signatu	re which is		
1/3/2006	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
1/3/2006	Reviewed email from McSherry including PDF letter to ST	from Barry Altman to the 295.00	group. 1.50	442.50	Billable
1/3/2006	Review emails and Settlement articles ST	295.00	1.50	442.50	Billable
1/3/2006	Conference call w/LEF and REW LEF	495.00	1.50	742.50	Billable
1/3/2006	Conference call with REW and SGT LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from Friedman to counsel attaching	FEARS case, SDNY, 20	005;		
1/3/2006	comments from R. Green "aptly named". LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
1/3/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn advising of her absent Hearing; K. Opsahl to attend in her stead, but she is LEF		oroval 0.40	198.00	Billable
1/3/2006	Reviewed emails from C. McSherry commenting that states, "Sony approached plaintiffs to begin settleme Friedman noting need to advise timeline and other ecomments; McSherry agreeing to talk to all on Thurse LEF	ent in December, 2005. vidence in support of Mo	J.	198.00	Billable
1/3/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to Elizabeth Pritzker at Agreement from class counsel to EFF; hoping to hav			99.00	Billable
.,0,2000				33.00	Dillapie
	Reviewed email from Kurt Opsahl noting timeline too		earch Blog		

with J. Friedman noting importance of confidentiality.

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 18

Sony Rootkit: (continued)

ate	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Tota
1/3/2006		495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn advising of her availability to join Rothman responding; looking forward to meeting with C. Cohn.			407.50	Dill - L L
1/3/2006	REW	325.00	1.50	487.50	Billable
1/4/2006	Conference call with EFF and co-counsel, re: settlement; Janua LEF	ary 6th hearin 495.00	ng. 0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to Paul Singer asking if he has he the Class Action Settlement and to discuss same with him.				D:11 1 1
1/4/2006	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
1/4/2006	Composed and forwarded email to C. Cohn noting importance LEF	of "creative o 495.00	bjecting". 0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from R. Kathrein to C. Cohn suggesting possible settlement agreement.				
1/4/2006	LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
1/4/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to Pritzker advising that she will be Sony BMG on Friday before hearing to discuss what the Banner Legal Notices should look like when Sony launches page on Fe LEF	s, Landing P	age and	148.50	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to Tracy, re: what banners loo email from Tracy.	ik like; review	ea return		
1/4/2006		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billabl
	Reviewed email from Kurt Opsahl with his review opinion of MV and Black Motorcycle; there are no banner ads or other stuff.				
1/4/2006	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billabl
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to Jeff and Bruce telling them that York on Friday, and can she review the Landing page ahead of	time.			
1/4/2006	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billabl
1/4/2006	Composed and forwarded email to R. Rothman displaying "Bar LEF	nners". 495.00	0.30	148.50	Billabl
1/4/2006	Reviewed email from R. Rothman wondering if settlement agreemay want to highlight some of the relief, i.e., CD replacement, fruitful.	•		99.00	Billabl
1/4/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn forwarding message frm Pritzker Ads; Kurt Opsahl email responding on Banners as not being ex LEF			99.00	Billabl

Reviewed email from J. Friedman to C. Cohn asking "did you Pro Hac in NY"; Kurt Opsahl responding to Friedman, they have not gotten Pro Hac in NY yet and are not hopeful to do so with the State Bar in time.

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 19

ate	User Task	Rate M arkup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Tota
1/4/2006		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to McSherry, noticed in myla Sony (2 years ago), that the offices were barren and empty, at are still on racks.				
1/4/2006	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
1/4/2006	Composed and forwarded email to SGT, re: EM plaintiffs. ST	295.00	1.50	442.50	Billable
1/4/2006	Review emails LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from McSherry regarding Glenn Walkins' Fla	. investigation;	sending		
1/4/2006	him MM information. REW	325.00	0.50	162.50	Billable
1/5/2006	Conference call with SGT LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from Kurt Opsahl forwarding Las Vegas artic	cle conceming s	Sony's copy		
1/5/2006	protection program. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billabl
1/5/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn forwarding samples of securit LEF	y notices. 495.00	0.50	247.50	Billabl
	Composed and forwarded email to C. Cohn who forwarded in	ndividual lawsu	iit of Mark		
1/5/2006	Lyon. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
1/5/2006	Composed and forwarded email to K. Opsahl showing Bann LEF	ers. 495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from Jenelle Welling regarding Exhibit "C" in agreement.	the final settler	ment		
1/5/2006	•	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from McSherry to Jenelle, re: we are aware on this	of the notice but	t not the		
1/5/2006	exhibit. LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billabl
	Reviewed email from James Tyre noting that Mark Lyons has	had the docum	nents and		
1/6/2006	exhibits. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from Corynne McSherry noting Preliminary A must issue by February 15, 2006; objections by May 1, 2006 a 22, 2006.				
1/6/2006		495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from Jenelle Welling asking how hearing we	ent.			

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 20

Sony Rootkit: (continued)

to put the letter in good form.

Date	User Task	Rate M arkup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
1/6/2006		495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
1/6/2006	Reviewed email from R. Green attaching Order transferring NLEF	Melcon case to \$ 495.00	SDNY. 0.20	99.00	Billable
1/6/2006	Reviewed email from James Tyre commenting on his knowle LEF	edge of Mark Ly 495.00	on. 0.10	49.50	Billable
1/6/2006	Reviewed email from Von Lohmann noting complaint was re LEF	eceived on Boin 495.00	g Boing net 0.20	99.00	Billable
1/7/2006	Reviewed email from J. Friedman attaching an uncomplimed Comm with Jacobson concurring. LEF	ntary piece rega 495.00	ording Sunn	99.00	Billable
1/7/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn forwarding note from Bill Hedl complementing EFF; believes they made a good settlement. LEF	-	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl, re: note to C. Cohn regarding	ng USENET po:	sts DRM		
1/7/2006	programmers asking for help writing software.	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from James Tyre; K. Opsahl wrote that Bit R	ate of 193 or Cl	O quality is		
1/7/2006	recommended. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn outlining the list that EFF agree	ed to, including	Banners,		
1/8/2006	Google words, etc. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl to James Tyre (Kurt's To Do of anti-spyware in the September 5 issue of Consumer Repo	,	ing ratings		
1/8/2006	· ·	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from Cunnard and Jacobson; Court granted	d Preliminary Ap	proval of		
1/9/2006	Settlement. LEF	495.00	1.00	495.00	Billable
1/9/2006	Reviewed email from R. Rothman attaching transcript of Frid LEF	day's hearing. 495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn, re: considering sending a dr	aft to Texas AG	and to		
1/9/2006	Mediamax LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from J. Friedman to Cohn suggesting letter	be put in prope	r order		
1/9/2006	explaining the settlement. LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from Robert Green agreeing with Friedman	's suggestion, b	out be sure		

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 21

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
1/9/2006	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
1/10/2006	Composed and forwarded email adding to reserve EFF's rights official position on this but wanted the AG to have the benefit of LEF	•		99.00	Billable
1/10/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn forwarding legal notice docume LEF	nt, re: settlen 495.00	nent. 0.10	49.50	Billable
1/10/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn asking for any comments on the LEF	notice. 495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn, re: her meeting with the two Je	ffs and their r	eaction to		
1/10/2006	the Banner Ads, which were not favorable. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn giving her comments on the Set	tlement Agree	ement and		
1/10/2006	problem with the notice not mentioning Patches and its layout. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email, re: we do our own "guerilla n	otice"; we sh	ould send it		
1/12/2006	out on Blogs and websites and wherever possible. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn commenting on Sony Settlemen	t, i.e., too lon	g and a bit		
1/12/2006	aggressive. LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from McSherry attaching a short summary of c	hanges to EF	Fs FAQ's		
1/12/2006	that Sony wants changed. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to Pritzker forwarding copy of De	legation Agre	ement and		
1/12/2006	asking if this can now be finalized. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from Jeff Cunnard acknowledging EFF's FAQ's	and their co	mmitment		
1/12/2006	to the settlement. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to REW and MQ forwarding C		il to Jeff		
1/13/2006	Cunnard outlining EFF's commitment to getting settlement app LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C.Cohn's confirmation to Elizabeth Pritzk	er promising	a letter		
1/15/2006	agreement by Monday, January 16, 2006, at the latest. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. McSherry negatively commenting on N Sunn Comm #2487.	lediaMax's re	view by		

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 22

Date	User Task	Rate M arkup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Tota
1/15/2006	LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from Kurt Opsahl, re: Sunn Comm Version 6.	n's latest summary of Med	dia Ma x,		
1/16/2006		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl forwarding copy of hundreds of thousands of Rootkits are still wide sp				
1/16/2006	·	325.00	0.25	81.25	Billabl
1/17/2006	Reviewed Delegation Agreement. LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billabl
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn asking if anyone has helped draft document.	s ideas for Kurt Opsahl, s	ince he		
1/17/2006		495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl asking for more re of Motion for Preliminary Approval. (2590)	cent version of document	tin support		
1/17/2006		495.00	0.10	49.50	Billabl
	Reviewed email from J. Friedman announcing med 26th, regarding fees.	eting with Jeff J. in New Yo	ork on the		
1/17/2006	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billab
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl saying that C. Coh Full Form Notice and attach Security Focus, wherei widespread. (#2606)	_	-		
1/17/2006		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billab
1/18/2006	Reviewed email from C. McSherry commenting on LEF	a few edits and additions 495.00	s. (#2610) 0.30	148.50	Billab
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl's email to Jeff Cur Form Notice and idea for making the need for class software and email from Jeff Friedman okaying Ku	s members to update or i	uninstall		
1/18/2006		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billab
	Reviewed email from Kurt Opsahl regarding article action involving Netflix may be rewritten in respons consumers while rewarding company.				
1/18/2006		495.00	0.30	148.50	Billabl
	Composed and forwarded response to J. Friedma New York; also promising to forward click fraud ma	• •	with J. J. in		
1/19/2006	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billabl
1/19/2006	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl thanking LEF for s LEF	ending click fraud inform 495.00	ation. 0.20	99.00	Billab
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl to Elizabeth and Je Banners.	eff forwarding drafts of the	Security		

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 23

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
1/19/2006		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
1/20/2006	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl to group forwarding images of citing danger of software creating security risks for computers. LEF	Class Settle	ment Notice 0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from Cindy Cohn to E. Pritzker, re: designated draft of Protective Order for us to review.	agreement; i	s there a		
1/26/2006	REW	325.00	0.25	81.25	Billable
1/30/2006	Drafted LEF pro hac declaration; letter to PA Supreme Court: Ce Standing.	ertification of 495.00	Good 0.10	49.50	Billable
1700/2000				40.00	Dilable
1/30/2006	Reviewed email from C. McSherry providing phone number and conference call. LEF	495.00	or 0.70	346.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to Jeff, Jeff and Bruce listing cond	cerns about t	the Notice		
1/30/2006	Issue. (Lengthy email) LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl with list of CDs w/Sunn Comm	MediaMax5	and		
1/30/2006	MediaMax3. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl forwarding copy of letter sent to (Sunn Comm) responding to his (Opsahl) letter.	him by Andr	ew DeVore		
1/30/2006		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to REW of R. Rothman's reque	est for Pro Ha	ac Vice		
1/30/2006	Declaration and Original Certificates of Good Standing. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from R. Rothman asking all attorneys to forward Declaration and ORIG Certificate of Good Standing directly to him		се		
1/30/2006	•	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to Jeff and Bruce regarding dead settlement benefits; there is much to discuss, i.e., artists/fans, b				
1/30/2006	with banner capability, etc. LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to E. Pritzker noting that she is was Delegation Agreement and asking status of Protective Order and the Polymer House Inc.				
1/30/2006	for February launch. LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
1/20/2000	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to Aaron Sheanin regarding her enoting that since Elizabeth is away, could he take over for her.			40.50	Dill-L1-
1/30/2006	LCF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. McSherry establishing time at 3:30.				

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 24

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
1/30/2006	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
1/30/2006	Composed and forwarded email asking eastern standard or v LEF	vest coast tim 495.00	e. 0.10	49.50	Billable
1/30/2006	Reviewed email from Jenelle Welling agreeing to time of mee LEF	ting, 3:15 to 3: 495.00	30. 0.10	49.50	Billable
1/30/2006	Reviewed email from C. McSherry requesting Jeff F. and EFF of fee situation. Also, asking if GW is free. LEF	conference cal 495.00	II regarding 0.10	49.50	Billable
1/31/2006	Reviewed emails from J. Welling agreeing to time; asking if of Rothman email agreeing to time and asking for call in numbe LEF	-	unsel, R. 0.20	99.00	Billable
1/31/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn asking for the "language" so sh response. LEF	ne can use it ir 495.00	n her 0.50	247.50	Billable
	Composed and forwarded to R. Green and Friedman; he has Dmusic; and doing a newsletter and also one on leflaw.com; list.				
1/31/2006	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
1/31/2006	Reviewed email from James Tyre suggesting everyone look a January 24 where he and Alex Halderman discuss an acaden LEF			148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from J. Friedman to R. Green with need to do up closing rates and monetize injunctive portion and discussiconduct.		_		
1/31/2006		495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from R. Green to J. Friedman discussing plat to be taken to maximize utilization.	n about what s	steps need		
1/31/2006		495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from R. Green responding to C. Cohn's cite of addressing amount of attorneys' fees.	of US Dist. Ct. o	document		
1/31/2006		495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from Jeff Friedman to C. Cohn forwarding US	Dist. Ct. docu	ıment		
1/31/2006	regarding attorneys' fees. LEF	495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
1/31/2006	Reviewed email from R. Green to Jeff Friedman attaching two scheduled fees.	fee cases for 495.00	method of 0.30	148.50	Billable
110 112000	Reviewed email from R. Green regarding applying for fees co goes to presses".			1 10.00	Sinasio

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 25

Sony Rootkit: (continued)

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
1/31/2006		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
2/1/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to J. Jacobson comme LEF	nting on Sony BMG filir 495.00	ngs. 0.20	99.00	Billable
2/1/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn forwarding message from that progress has stalled, but all will be pleased with LEF			99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from J. Friedman discussing that Ord Motion was resubmitted; Jeff F. going to prepare a pre- preparing Motion to Vacate Order, etc.				
2/1/2006	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to Jenelle, we should were not consulted by Class Counsel.	•	ŭ		
2/1/2006	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
0/4/2000	Reviewed email from J. Friedman forwarding letter to eroding settlement.				
2/1/2006	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from J. Friedman to Jenell, McSherry, are class reps. (NOT GOOD); response by Jenelle is a clients either.				
2/1/2006		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn asking if we should me the Settlement Agreement and no changes should be counsel.				
2/1/2006		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl responding to C. Coh should be emphasized.	n that it is an importan	t piece and		
2/1/2006		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from J. Friedman to C. Cohn; his thin explicit as that, more importantly they failed to adequate		re not as		
2/1/2006	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from J. Friedman to C. Cohn, Kamber the authority to sign on behalf of all parties.		·		
2/1/2006	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. McSherry to all; interested in a available regarding responding to Kamber and Sony's knowledge or consent. Is 3:00 okay?				
2/1/2006		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable

Reviewed email from McSherry filling Cindy and Jenelle on next steps; 1-Order signed; 2-Jeff going to write letter; 3- GWwill do research; 4-Cindy not to email Jeff J.

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 26

Sony Rootkit: (continued)

Cong i tooti	(Continuou)				
Date	User	Rate	Hours	Amount	Total
2/1/2006	Task	Markup % 495.00	DNB Time 0.10	DNB Amt 49.50	Billable
2/1/2000		430.00	0.10	43.50	Dillabic
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl giving all phone numbers and	passcodes.			
2/1/2006	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Parioused amail from P. Bothman to C. McChamy I EE is an the	lino: waiting	formu		
	Reviewed email from R. Rothman to C. McSherry, LEF is on the email noting that R. Green is on also.	e ine, waiting	ioi you,		
2/1/2006	•	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. McSherry regarding call asap, re: responsibilities and responsibilities are responsible to talk with Legach?	oonse to Sony	1		
2/1/2006	machinations; who is available to talk with Lerach?	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
2/1/2000		430.00	0.20	33.00	Dillabic
	Reviewed email from C. McSherry listing items to discuss on c				
	modifications; 2-proposed new Section III.W for settlement of c	lass member	s who do		
2/1/2006	not use promotional codes prior to expiration.	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
2/1/2000		400.00	0.10	40.00	Dillable
	Reviewed email from R. Rothman to McSherry, we will send ∞		all parties		
0/0/0000	simultaneous with faxing to the Judge; the court rules require it		0.40	40.50	Dillabla
2/2/2006	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from McSherry to R. Rothman; should we state	e what Motion	we intend		
	to make?				
2/2/2006	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to C. McSherry and J. Friedma	an "Motion to	Vacate		
	Order sur Notice of Pending Class Action.	an, wouding	vacate		
2/2/2006	<u> </u>	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Deliver Laws II for B. B. Harres to O. Oaker Law have a serie	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	1.4		
	Reviewed email from R. Rothman to C. Cohn; Jacobson says i call is off. I say send the letter.	if we send the	e leπer, your		
2/2/2006		495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to K. Opsahl asking if we can	start with dis	seminating		
2/2/2006	the banners.	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
2/2/2000		400.00	0.10	40.00	Diliabio
	Reviewed email from R. Rothman attaching a revised version of	of the letter wh	nich has		
0/2/2006	been 'Wordsmithed".	405.00	0.10	40.50	Pilloblo
2/3/2006	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl to C. Cohn and EFF stating ter	ms should re	ad 'within a		
	reasonable time and reasonable cost".				
2/3/2006	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to C. Cohn and group; "really	like these bar	nners"		
2/3/2006		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to R. Green commenting on h	nis letter to the	e Judge.		

Composed and forwarded email to R. Green commenting on his letter to the Judge. (Affirmative)

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 27

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
2/3/2006		495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
2/3/2006	Composed and forwarded email to Jeff Friedman adding "nice LEF	e" to Girard's le 495.00	etter. 0.10	49.50	Billable
2/3/2006	Composed and forwarded email to J. Friedman giving his pho conference call and passcode. LEF	ne number for 495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
2/4/2006	Composed and forwarded email to C. Cohn suggesting he wo the call at 7:30 (emphasis on LISTEN).	ould like to LIS 495.00	TEN in on	49.50	Billable
2/4/2000	LLI	433.00	0.10	43.50	Dillable
2/4/2006	Reviewed email from C. McSherry to LEF that Hatpin and Rach amendments. LEF	nitis are okay v 495.00	vith 0.50	247.50	Billable
2/6/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn forwarding Stipulated Motion to Agreement and Proposed Further Order Modifying Settlement LEF		ment 0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. McSherry, having not yet heard from E Designation Agreement, has drafted a demand letter, are there have we overstated the argument and should we cc Sony on the	e comments? nis?	Further,		
2/6/2006	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
2/6/2006	Reviewed email from R. Rothman, does not think there is a ne LEF	eed to cc Sony 495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from Shana Scarlett; had just spoken to Judge learned that Friday's Coordination Hearing has been taken off CR to all counsel.				
2/7/2006		495.00	0.50	247.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl forwarding Stipulated Motion to	o Amend Sett	ement		
2/7/2006	Agreement and Proposed Order. LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from J. Friedman, okay with Rob signing off or	n Amended M	odification		
2/7/2006	at this point. Everyone else okay? LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn noting that Sony is offering dow	nloads from C	Connect,		
2/7/2006	iTune, WalMart and FYE. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn forwarding responses of J. Jack email to all; can we send some initial things to him quickly?	obson to the N	lotices;		
2/7/2006		495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn agreeing; K. Opsahl it is worth a	adding.			

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 28

Solly Root	di. (Continued)				
Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
2/7/2006	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
2/7/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn forwarding Settlement Adr LEF	ministration website 495.00	e. 0.10	49.50	Billable
2/7 <i>/</i> 2006	Reviewed email from James Tyre, WalMart is wma; Conrestrictions. LEF	nect is DRM with EU 495.00	JLA 0.40	198.00	Billable
2/7/2006	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl discussing S. A website say how privacy will be protected; why email address is r LEF		nould we	99.00	Billable
2/7/2006	Composed and forwarded email in response suggesting accomplish the above suggestions by K. Opsahl. LEF	g Dmusic would be 495.00	able to 0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from Von Lohmann's email responding	to C. Cohn's email	of MP3		
2/7/2006	downloads. LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl adding link to current dra	aft of Settlement Adr	ministration		
2/7 <i>/</i> 2006	website.	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl agreeing that \$15.00 wa	s the "Floor" and no	ot the		
2/7/2006	"Ceiling" to be considered. LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from R. Rothman, re: provision should one such alternative will be a refund of the purchase price this barrais greater.				
2/7/2006	whichever is greater. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl "Confidential" Discussion				
2/7/2006	Communication language for the Alternative Benefits Pro LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed emails from McSherry and R. Green thanking	Shana Scarlett for fo	ollowing up		
2/7/2006	on that. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to K. Opsahl, "if it is an certifying to class counsel rather than EFF (LEF indicating		•		
2/8/2006	language either.) LEF	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn forwarding attachment "N		Vark Lyon		
2/8/2006	wondering if he is right "Can you sue once you opt out?". LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from R. Green discussing paragraph 24	4 of the Order.			

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 29

ate	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Tota
2/8/2006		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billabl
2/8/2006	Reviewed email from Barak Weinstein to all enclosuLEF	sing Elizabeth Pritzker let 495.00	ter. 0.40	198.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. McSherry, Cindy and I just makes sense to drop a quick note to Cory at Boing able to opt out as soon as the settlement site goes out, they are not part of the settlement class and a choose to. If you folks agree that this is a correct in please confirm, and we will send a note. Thanks.	g Boing explaining that 1-to s live next week and 2- or re therefore free to file an	folks will be ace they opt y action they		
2/8/2006	LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billabl
	Reviewed email from C. McSherry to R. Green; bro by Mark Lyon.	ad discussion of the Noti	ce of Appeal		
2/8/2006	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from R. Green to C. Cohn and grout he can bring his own suit for costs.	oup; he can opt our, and o	nce he opts		
2/8/2006	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl to J. Jacobson, just and loaded up MediaMax, likewise did not have gri		∞mputer		
2/8/2006	LEF	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billabl
	Reviewed email from C. McSherry discussing Pritz will have to go to the court to get the promised delet to hash out the est way to get that done and, since whether we want to try for more. What are your tho LEF	egation accomplished. We have to go to court ar	ve are trying	198.00	Billabl
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to Jeff discussing the corporate as opposed to our catchy); should say "yetc.				
2/8/2006		495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to Jeff and all others for costs; also agree with Scott as to why personal what is going to be done with it.				
2/8/2006		495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl questioning the grand clarity of statement "may be entitled? as opposition of the company of the		and notice		
2/8/2006	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
2/8/2006	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl to J. Friedman asl agreed motion and proposed order; if so, please s LEF		th draft 0.40	198.00	Billabl
	Composed and forwarded email to K. Opsahl forw Canadian Anti-Sony Lawyer".	rarding website view of "ir	nterview with		

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 30

Sony Rootkit: (continued)

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
2/9/2006		495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to C. McSherry regarding dive	rse range of	oractice		
2/9/2006	areas. LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from R. Green to C. McSherry, re: Corynne, I w	ould like to w	eigh in on		
2/9/2006	this. I will have some points where I can call in. LEF	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to C. McSherry in response to	his email re	garding		
2/9/2006	opting out. LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
2/10/2006	Reviewed email from McSherry thanking R. Green for input. LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from Jenelle Welling speaking for Robert and	herself, may	be available		
2/10/2006	for telephone conference from the airport around 1:30. LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. McSherry to R. Green asking if he is a	vailable for te	elephone		
2/10/2006	call on Thursday at 2 p.m. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn answering that this is a feature		o could do		
2/10/2006	or not use. Case settled too fast. We did not have time for disc LEF	covery. 495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. McSherry to Jenelle Welling; okaying of also that EFF is thinking of rolling out a "Make Sony Pay" camp				
2/10/2006	Welling correcting McSherry time zone (should be EST). LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email responding to C. McSherry, N	NKE SONY P	AY, and		
2/10/2006	sign me up. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn commenting on Sony replaces	Lack as CEO	with the		
2/10/2006	scandal over Rootkit being the reason. LEF	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn, re: Corynne forwarding Jacobs	on email to a	III regarding		
2/10/2006	XCP CDs, MediaMax CSs, etc. LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
2/11/2006	Reviewed email from J. Friedman to C. Cohn questioning why LEF	this is so. 495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable

Reviewed email from C. McSherry regarding forwarding message she received from Sony and Sony BMG Music Entertainment CD containing XCP or MediaMax, your rights may be affected.

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 31

Sony Rootkit: (continued)

Conference call w/SGT and counsel.

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
2/11/2006	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
2/13/2006	Composed and forwarded email to J. Friedman commenting o in People Magazine. LEF	n Sony's artic	le he read	148.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from Robert Green to C. McSherry regarding di				5676
2/13/2006	enforce the agreement. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
2/13/2006	Reviewed email from Barak Weinstein forwarding letter from E. states that she and Scott did not enter into an agreement with ELEF		rein she 0.20	99.00	Billable
2/13/2006	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl to Sony regarding agreement to LEF	o delegate. 495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
2/14/2006	Composed and forwarded email to K. Opsahl regarding right to ST	reject the ag 295.00	reement. 0.30	88.50	Billable
2/14/2006	Composed and forwarded email to all regarding notice plaintiff received from Sony.	•		00.00	Dillate
2/14/2000		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
2/14/2006	Reviewed email from J. Friedman's email to all regarding chan paragraph in settlement that provides for modification, etc. LEF	ge leverage a 495.00	and 0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. McSherry to all forwarding draft letter to	E. Pritzker a	sking for		
2/14/2006	responses.	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from J. Welling to LEF responding that she will	be out of the	office on		
2/14/2006	the 13th and 14th, but will respond to LEF when she returns. LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
2/14/2006	Reviewed email from J. Friedman asking for call in number. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Composed and forwarded email to McSherry regarding Alexa ra	ankings of EF	F.org and		
2/14/2006	sonybmg.com LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
2/14/2006	Reviewed email from C. McSherry reminding all of the 1:30 EST ST	conference 295.00	call. 0.70	206.50	Billable
2/14/2006	Conference call w/LEF and counsel. LEF	495.00	0.70	346.50	Billable

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 32

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
2/14/2006		495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. McSherry giving site to see Felten/Hald debacle.	eman paper	on Sony		
2/16/2006	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from E. Pritzker's email to C. Cohn asking if she meeting on February 17.				
2/16/2006	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
2/16/2006	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl forwarding excerpt from San Fra February 15, 2006 article.	ancisco, Bus 495.00	iness Wire,	49.50	Billable
2/10/2000		100.00	0.10	10.00	Dillabio
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl regarding conversations with P of EFF.	ritzker and a	dvantages		
2/16/2006		495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	District Control District Control				
2/16/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to E. Pritzker regarding meeting. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
2/16/2006	Composed and forwarded email to all regarding defense couns	sel. 495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
27 10/2000				, , , , ,	
2/16/2006	Reviewed email from J. Jacobson to C. Cohn in response to he	r request for 495.00	a meeting. 0.10	49.50	Billable
2/10/2000		400.00	0.10	10.00	Diliabio
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn's email to E. Pritzker disagreeing	with interpre	etation of		
2/17/2006	situation and asking for a meeting. LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
2/17/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to all regarding responses to Prit	tzker's meeti 495.00	ng request. 0.10	49.50	Billable
2/1//2000					
	Reviewed email from James Tyre to all noting Homeland Secur outlawing Rootkits.	ity official su	ggests		
2/17/2006		495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Deviation of amoil from C. McCham, C. Cahn and I. Fradman all	l dio augoina	time and		
	Reviewed email from C. McSherry, C. Cohn and J. Friedman, all place for meeting.	ascussing	ume and		
2/17/2006		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed emails from all regarding meeting.				
2/20/2006		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed emails between K. Opsahl, C. McSherry and C. Cohn	re telecon	ference		
2/21/2006	•	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl to Sony.				
2/21/2006		495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl detailing settlement agreemen	t			
	The first of than from the Operating settlement agreement				

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 33

Sony Rootkit: (continued)

Reviewed email from ICG reminding LEF of conference call. EF Reviewed email from C. McSherry to Welling and others, re: phasscode. EF Reviewed email from Shana Scarlett, re: call. EF	495.00 495.00 none number 495.00	0.10 0.10 and 0.10	49.50 49.50	Billable Billable
EF Reviewed email from C. McSherry to Welling and others, re: phasscode. EF Reviewed email from Shana Scarlett, re: call.	one number	and	49.50	Billable
asscode. EF Reviewed email from Shana Scarlett, re: call.				
Reviewed email from Shana Scarlett, re: call.			49.50	Billable
	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
Reviewed email from K. Opsahl to C. McSherry, re: Rule 23(g). EF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
Reviewed email from McSherry discussing necessity of strateg EF	y call for Febr 495.00	uary 22. 0.10	49.50	Billable
Reviewed email from R. Rothman, re: discussion of Pritzker m EF	eeting. 495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
Reviewed email from Jenelle Welling agreeing to February 22 (EF	call and time 495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
Reviewed email from C. McSherry regarding his reply. EF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
Reviewed email from K. Opsahl, re: Sony BMG settlement. EF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
Reviewed email from C. Cohn's email to E. Pritzker, re: charac EF	terizations of 495.00	the case. 0.30	148.50	Billable
Composed and forwarded email to Kopshal, re: class member EF	ers under the a 495.00	age of 13. 0.20	99.00	Billable
Reviewed email from C. Cohn to all, re: Sony notice document EF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
Reviewed email from J. Friedman, re: secuirty issues for 5.0. EF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
Reviewed email from Jenelle Welling to all, re: GGD/Kamber lo EF	etter. 495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
Reviewed email from J. Friedman, re: response to J. Wellings EF	vote. 495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
Composed and forwarded email in agreement with the carbon EF	copying of le 495.00	tter. 0.30	148.50	Billable
E REE REE REE REE REE	eviewed email from R. Rothman, re: discussion of Pritzker meters eviewed email from Jenelle Welling agreeing to February 22 of the eviewed email from C. McSherry regarding his reply. Eviewed email from K. Opsahl, re: Sony BMG settlement. Eviewed email from C. Cohn's email to E. Pritzker, re: characters eviewed email from C. Cohn's email to Kopshal, re: class members eviewed email from C. Cohn to all, re: Sony notice document in the eviewed email from J. Friedman, re: secuirty issues for 5.0. Eviewed email from Jenelle Welling to all, re: GGD/Kamber lesses eviewed email from J. Friedman, re: response to J. Wellings' is proposed and forwarded email in agreement with the carbon is proposed and forwarded email in agreement with the carbon is proposed and forwarded email in agreement with the carbon is proposed and forwarded email in agreement with the carbon is proposed and forwarded email in agreement with the carbon is proposed and forwarded email in agreement with the carbon is proposed and forwarded email in agreement with the carbon is proposed and forwarded email in agreement with the carbon is proposed and forwarded email in agreement with the carbon is proposed and forwarded email in agreement with the carbon is proposed in the carbon is proposed and forwarded email in agreement with the carbon is proposed in the	wiewed email from R. Rothman, re: discussion of Pritzker meeting. 495.00 wiewed email from Jenelle Welling agreeing to February 22 call and time. 495.00 wiewed email from C. McSherry regarding his reply. F. 495.00 wiewed email from K. Opsahl, re: Sony BMG settlement. F. 495.00 wiewed email from C. Cohn's email to E. Pritzker, re: characterizations of 495.00 composed and forwarded email to Kopshal, re: class members under the 495.00 composed email from C. Cohn to all, re: Sony notice document. F. 495.00 wiewed email from J. Friedman, re: secuirty issues for 5.0. F. 495.00 wiewed email from Jenelle Welling to all, re: GGD/Kamber letter. F. 495.00 wiewed email from J. Friedman, re: response to J. Wellings' vote. F. 495.00 composed and forwarded email in agreement with the carbon copying of let	eviewed email from R. Rothman, re: discussion of Pritzker meeting. 495.00 0.10 Eviewed email from Jenelle Welling agreeing to February 22 call and time. 495.00 0.20 Eviewed email from C. McSherry regarding his reply. Eviewed email from K. Opsahl, re: Sony BMG settlement. EVIE 495.00 0.30 Eviewed email from C. Cohn's email to E. Pritzker, re: characterizations of the case. 495.00 0.30 Eviewed email from C. Cohn's email to Kopshal, re: class members under the age of 13. 495.00 0.20 Eviewed email from C. Cohn to all, re: Sony notice document. EVIE 495.00 0.20 Eviewed email from J. Friedman, re: secuirty issues for 5.0. EVIEWED AGENT AG	wiewed email from R. Rothman, re: discussion of Pritzker meeting. Fereign Meeting Melling agreeing to February 22 call and time. Fereign Meeting Melling agreeing to February 22 call and time. Fereign Meeting Melling agreeing to February 22 call and time. Fereign Meeting Melling agreeing to February 22 call and time. Fereign Meeting Melling Melling his reply. Fereign Meeting Melling Melling his reply. Fereign Meeting Melling Melling his reply. Fereign Melling Melling his reply. Fereign Melling Melling his reply. Fereign

Reviewed email from C. Cohn's email to E. Pritzker, etc., re: forwarding four page letter she sent to Jeff Cunnard.

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 34

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
2/23/2006	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl, re: tentatively planning on hear office for meeting.	ding down to	Pritzker's		
2/28/2006	LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn, re: forwarding Jeff Cunnard and her letter.	Jeff Jacobs	on's reply to		
3/1/2006	LEF	495.00	0.40	198.00	Billable
3/1/2006	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl, re: extensive notes from meeting LEF	ing. 495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
3/1/2006	Reviewed email from S. Scarlett, re: waive argument on the MD LEF	L petition. 495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
3/1/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn forwarding E. Pritzker's cover lette LEF	er. 495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
3/1/2006	Reviewed email from C. McSherry, re: Sony BMG CD settlemen LEF	t and sales i 495.00	numbers. 0.10	49.50	Billable
3/3/2006	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl response to McSherry. LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn's email to all, re: I think it would I	be best to la	unch ours		
3/3/2006	and Larry's at the same time. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
3/3/2006	Composed and forwarded email to all, re: banners. LEF	495.00	0.30	148.50	Billable
3/3/2006	Composed and forwarded email to all, re: Sony Affidavit. LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
3/3/2006	Composed and forwarded email to C. Cohn, re: our call. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
3/3/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to all, re: meeting with Dan Girar LEF	rd. 495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
3/3/2006	Reviewed email from C. McSherry email to LEF, re: banners. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
3/3/2006	Reviewed email from C. McSherry's email to C. Cohn, re: miscalLEF	ellaneous So 495.00	ony issues. 0.20	99.00	Billable
3/7/2006	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl's email to Elizabeth, re: banne LEF	r ad function 495.00	ality. 0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to all, re: settle up with Sony.				

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 35

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
3/7/2006	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
3/7/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to all, re: Pritzker in response to LEF	o Cohn's ques 495.00	stions. 0.10	49.50	Billable
3/7/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn forwarded to all R. Kathrein's er LEF	mail. 495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
3/7/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn's email to Elizabeth Pritzer, re: agreement. LEF	draft of delega 495.00	otion 0.10	49.50	Billable
3/8/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn, re: nothing yet from Elizabeth o	on the agreem 295.00	ent. 1.20	354.00	Billable
3/8/2006	Prepare notice.	90.00	8.00	720.00	Billable
3/9/2006	Send out notice to class members via email.	90.00	10.00	900.00	Billable
3/10/2006	Send out notice to class members via email.	90.00	6.00	540.00	Billable
3/11/2006	Send out notice to class members via email. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
3/15/2006	Composed and forwarded email, re: downloaded documents LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
3/16/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohri, re: forwarded J. Jacobson's left LEF	tter regarding 495.00	EFF to Sony. 1.00	495.00	Billable
3/16/2006	Telephone conversation with Jeff Friedman. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
3/17/2006	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl, re: commenting on J. Jacobs- LEF	on's letter to C 495.00	C. Cohn. 0.20	99.00	Billable
3/17/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn to all, re: Sony BMG team. LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
3/17/2006	Reviewed email from J. Friedman's email to all, re: lodestar. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
3/17/2006	Reviewed email from C. Cohn, re: trademark stuff. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
3/17/2006	Reviewed email from J. Friedman answering C. Cohn's sugget LEF	estions. 495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from K. Opsahl to Cindy Cohn, re: Thomas He	esse.			

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 36

Reviewed email from C. Cohn, re: sale of banners in Canada; Ed Felton not willing to pay expert frees (will explain later). 3/27/2006 LEF Reviewed email from C. Cohn, re: sale of banners in Canada; Ed Felton not willing to pay expert frees (will explain later). 3/27/2006 LEF Reviewed email from C. Cohn, re: Sony withdraws from Sony v. Does. 3/24/2006 LEF Reviewed email from Ray Beckerman, re: Sony withdraws from Sony v. Does. 3/24/2006 LEF Reviewed email from Ray Beckerman, re: Sony withdraws from Sony v. Does. 3/24/2006 LEF Reviewed email from Ray Beckerman, re: Sony withdraws from Sony v. Does. 3/24/2006 LEF Reviewed email from Ray Beckerman, re: Sony withdraws from Sony v. Does. 3/24/2006 LEF Reviewed email from Ray Beckerman, re: Sony withdraws from Sony v. Does. 3/24/2006 LEF Reviewed email from Roy Beckerman, re: Sony withdraws from Sony v. Does. 3/24/2006 LEF Reviewed email from C. Cohn, re: sale of banners in Canada; Ed Felton not willing to pay expert fees (will explain later). 3/27/2006 LEF Reviewed email from C. Cohn, re: sale of banners in Canada; Ed Felton not willing to pay expert fees (will explain later). 3/27/2006 LEF Reviewed email from K. Opsahl addressing comment by Julie Lender of EFF who noted that a Best Buy in FL was still selling "poisoned" XCP CDs in volation of the Sony recall. (Different [prices for clean and poisoned versions.) 3/28/2006 LEF Reviewed email from Von Lohman to C. Cohn asking if EFF has any infor, regarding use of DRM overtime by Sony; S. Scarlett responding with offer to help find out. 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat Reviewed email from SGT to MUX. "tet us know what you did as far as disseminating via email notice of the Sony-BMG Rootkit settlement" with response; "here are the groups I sent to, Dmusic, Boycott-RIAA the notice network list. Reviewed email from C. Cohn giving telephone number for conference; LEF asking which phone is involved.	Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
3/18/2006 LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billal Reviewed Barak Weinstein's email forwarding Pritzker's letter to C. Cohn, re: work assignment letter, i.e., timetable, budget and key personnel to be involved. 3/20/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billal Reviewed email from C. Cohn forwarding letter to J. Jacobson from E. Pritzker commenting j.i.e., that the trademark objections to EFF efforts are baseless. 3/20/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billal Reviewed email from Shana Scarlett requesting copy of EULA as a basis for settlement agreement agreement. 3/22/2006 LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billal Reviewed email from Ray Beckerman, re: Sony withdraws from Sony v. Does. 3/24/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billal Reviewed email from Ray Beckerman, re: Sony withdraws from Sony v. Does. 3/24/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billal Reviewed email from S. Scarlett commenting that she gave expert the number of XCP and MMCDs sold from defendant's letter to AGS. 3/24/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billal Reviewed email from C. Cohn, re: sale of banners in Canada; Ed Felton not willing to pay expert fees (will explain later). 3/27/2006 LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billal Reviewed email from K. Opsahl addressing comment by Julie Lender of EFF who noted that a Best Buy in FL was still selling "poisoned" XCP CDs in violation of the Sony recall. (Different [prices for clean and poisoned versions.) 3/28/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billal Reviewed email from Von Lohman to C. Cohn asking if EFF has any infor, regarding use of DRM overtime by Sony; S. Scarlett responding with offer to help find out 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billal Reviewed email from SGT to MUX. "let us know what you did as far as disseminating via email notice of the Sony-BMG Rootkit settlement" with response; "here are the groups I sent to, Dmusic, Boycott-RIAA, the notice network list. 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billal Reviewed email from SGT to MUX. "let us know what you did as far as disseminating via email notice of the Sony-BMG Rootkit settlement" with response; "here are the groups I sent to, Dmusic, Boycott-R	3/17/2006					Billable
assignment letter, i.e., timetable, budget and key personnel to be involved. 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billat Reviewed email from C. Cohn forwarding letter to J. Jacobson from E. Pritzker commenting, i.e., that the trademark objections to EFF efforts are baseless. 3/20/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billat Reviewed email from Shana Scarlett requesting copy of EULA as a basis for settlement agreement. 3/22/2006 LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat Reviewed email from Ray Beckerman, re: Sony withdraws from Sony v. Does. 3/24/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billat Reviewed email from S. Scarlett commenting that she gave expert the number of XCP and MM CDs sold from defendant's letter to AGS. 3/24/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billat Reviewed email from C. Cohn, re: sale of banners in Canada; Ed Felton not willing to pay expert fees (will explain later). 3/27/2006 LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat Reviewed email from K. Opsahl addressing comment by Julie Lender of EFF who noted that a Best Buy in FL was still selling "poisoned" XCP CDs in volation of the Sony recall. (Different (prices for clean and poisoned versions.) 3/28/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billat Reviewed email from Von Lohman to C. Cohn asking if EFF has any infor, regarding use of DRM overtime by Sony, S. Scarlett responding with offer to help find out. 3/28/2006 LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat Reviewed email from J. Friedman, re: Cindy and I want to have one hopefully brief call at 5.00 p.m. to close loop on final decision regarding fee application. In essence, we need to decide whether to accept/reject latest "offer" or file our fee application; R. Green, S. Scarlett. 3/29/2006 LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat Reviewed email from SGT to MUX "let us know what you did as far as disseminating via email notice of the Sony-BMG Rootkit settlement" with response; "here are the groups I sent to, Dmusic, Boycott-RIAA, the notice network list. 3/29/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billat	3/18/2006	· ·	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
commenting ,i.e., that the trademark objections to EFF efforts are baseless. 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billat Reviewed email from Shana Scarlett requesting copy of EULA as a basis for settlement agreement. 3/22/2006 LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat Reviewed email from Ray Beckerman, re: Sony withdraws from Sony v. Does. 3/24/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billat Reviewed email from S. Scarlett commenting that she gave expert the number of XCP and MMCDs sold from defendant's letter to AGS. 3/24/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billat Reviewed email from C. Cohn, re: sale of banners in Canada; Ed Felton not willing to pay expert fees (will explain later). 3/27/2006 LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat Reviewed email from K. Opsahl addressing comment by Julie Lender of EFF who noted that a Best Buy in FL was still selling "poisoned" XCP CDs in volation of the Sony recall. (Different [prices for clean and poisoned versions.) 3/28/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billat Reviewed email from Von Lohman to C. Cohn asking if EFF has any infor. regarding use of DRMovertime by Sony, S. Scarlett responding with offer to help find out. 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat Reviewed email from J. Friedman, re: Cindy and I want to have one hopefully brief call at 5.00 p.m. to close loop on final decision regarding fee application. In essence, we need to decide whether to accept/reject latest "offer" or file our fee application; R. Green, S. Scarlett. 3/29/2006 LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat Reviewed email from SGT to MUX. "let us know what you did as far as disseminating via email notice of the Sony-BMG Rootkit settlement" with response; "here are the groups I sent to, Dmusic, Boycott-RIAA, the notice network list. 3/29/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billat Reviewed email from C. Cohn giving telephone number for conference; LEF asking which phone is involved.	3/20/2006	assignment letter, i.e., timetable, budget and key personnel	I to be involved.		49.50	Billable
agreement Agroup LEF Agroup 0.20 Billat Reviewed email from Ray Beckerman, re: Sony withdraws from Sony v. Does. Agroup 0.10 Agro	3/20/2006	commenting ,i.e., that the trademark objections to EFF effor	ts are baseless.		49.50	Billable
3/24/2006 LEF Reviewed email from S. Scarlett commenting that she gave expert the number of XCP and MMCDs sold from defendant's letter to AGS. 3/24/2006 LEF Reviewed email from C. Cohn, re: sale of banners in Canada; Ed Felton not willing to pay expert fees (will explain later). 3/27/2006 LEF Reviewed email from K. Opsahl addressing comment by Julie Lender of EFF who noted that a Best Buy in FL was still selling "poisoned" XCP CDs in violation of the Sony recall. (Different [prices for clean and poisoned versions.) 3/28/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billat Reviewed email from Von Lohman to C. Cohn asking if EFF has any infor. regarding use of DRM overtime by Sony, S. Scarlett responding with offer to help find out. 3/28/2006 LEF Reviewed email from J. Friedman, re: Cindy and I want to have one hopefully brief call at 5:00 p.m. to close loop on final decision regarding fee application. In essence, we need to decide whether to accept/reject latest "offer" or file our fee application; R. Green, S. Scarlett. 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat Reviewed email from SGT to MUX, "let us know what you did as far as disseminating via email notice of the Sony-BMG Rootkit settlement" with response; "here are the groups I sent to, Dmusic, Boycott-RIAA, the notice network list. Reviewed email from C. Cohn giving telephone number for conference; LEF asking which phone is involved.	3/22/2006	agreement.			99.00	Billable
and MMCDs sold from defendant's letter to AGS. LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billat Reviewed email from C. Cohn, re: sale of banners in Canada; Ed Felton not willing to pay expert fees (will explain later). 3/27/2006 LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat Reviewed email from K. Opsahl addressing comment by Julie Lender of EFF who noted that a Best Buy in FL was still selling "poisoned" XCP CDs in violation of the Sony recall. (Different [prices for clean and poisoned versions.) 3/28/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billat Reviewed email from Von Lohman to C. Cohn asking if EFF has any infor. regarding use of DRM overtime by Sony, S. Scarlett responding with offer to help find out. LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat Reviewed email from J. Friedman, re: Cindy and I want to have one hopefully brief call at 5:00 p.m. to close loop on final decision regarding fee application. In essence, we need to decide whether to accept/reject latest "offer" or file our fee application, R. Green, S. Scarlett. 3/29/2006 LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat Reviewed email from SGT to MUX, "let us know what you did as far as disseminating via email notice of the Sony-BMG Rootkit settlement" with response; "here are the groups I sent to, Dmusic, Boycott-RIAA, the notice network list. 3/29/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billat Reviewed email from C. Cohn giving telephone number for conference; LEF asking which phone is involved.	3/24/2006		•		49.50	Billable
pay expert fees (will explain later). 3/27/2006 LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat Reviewed email from K. Opsahl addressing comment by Julie Lender of EFF who noted that a Best Buy in FL was still selling "poisoned" XCP CDs in violation of the Sony recall. (Different [prices for clean and poisoned versions.) 3/28/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billat Reviewed email from Von Lohman to C. Cohn asking if EFF has any infor. regarding use of DRM overtime by Sony, S. Scarlett responding with offer to help find out. LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat Reviewed email from J. Friedman, re: Cindy and I want to have one hopefully brief call at 5:00 p.m. to close loop on final decision regarding fee application. In essence, we need to decide whether to accept/reject latest "offer" or file our fee application; R. Green, S. Scarlett. 3/29/2006 LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat Reviewed email from SGT to MUX, "let us know what you did as far as disseminating via email notice of the Sony-BMG Rootkit settlement" with response; "here are the groups I sent to, Dmusic, Boycott-RIAA, the notice network list Reviewed email from C. Cohn giving telephone number for conference; LEF asking which phone is involved.	3/24/2006	and MM CDs sold from defendant's letter to AGS.	•		49.50	Billable
noted that a Best Buy in FL was still selling "poisoned" XCP CDs in violation of the Sony recall. (Different [prices for clean and poisoned versions.) 3/28/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billat Reviewed email from Von Lohman to C. Cohn asking if EFF has any infor. regarding use of DRM overtime by Sony, S. Scarlett responding with offer to help find out. 3/28/2006 LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat Reviewed email from J. Friedman, re: Cindy and I want to have one hopefully brief call at 5:00 p.m. to close loop on final decision regarding fee application. In essence, we need to decide whether to accept/reject latest "offer" or file our fee application; R. Green, S. Scarlett. 3/29/2006 LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat Reviewed email from SGT to MUX, "let us know what you did as far as disseminating via email notice of the Sony-BMG Rootkit settlement" with response; "here are the groups I sent to, Dmusic, Boycott-RIAA, the notice network list 3/29/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billat Reviewed email from C. Cohn giving telephone number for conference; LEF asking which phone is involved.	3/27/2006	pay expert fees (will explain later).			99.00	Billable
use of DRM overtime by Sony, S. Scarlett responding with offer to help find out. 3/28/2006 LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat Reviewed email from J. Friedman, re: Cindy and I want to have one hopefully brief call at 5:00 p.m. to close loop on final decision regarding fee application. In essence, we need to decide whether to accept/reject latest "offer" or file our fee application; R. Green, S. Scarlett. 3/29/2006 LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat Reviewed email from SGT to MUX, "let us know what you did as far as disseminating via email notice of the Sony-BMG Rootkit settlement" with response; "here are the groups I sent to, Dmusic, Boycott-RIAA, the notice network list. 3/29/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billat Reviewed email from C. Cohn giving telephone number for conference; LEF asking which phone is involved.	3/28/2006	noted that a Best Buy in FL was still selling "poisoned" XCP recall. (Different [prices for clean and poisoned versions.)	CDs in violation	of the Sony	49.50	Billable
at 5:00 p.m. to close loop on final decision regarding fee application. In essence, we need to decide whether to accept/reject latest "offer" or file our fee application; R. Green, S. Scarlett. 3/29/2006 LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billal Reviewed email from SGT to MUX, "let us know what you did as far as disseminating via email notice of the Sony-BMG Rootkit settlement" with response; "here are the groups I sent to, Dmusic, Boycott-RIAA, the notice network list. 3/29/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billal Reviewed email from C. Cohn giving telephone number for conference; LEF asking which phone is involved.	3/28/2006	use of DRM overtime by Sony, S. Scarlett responding with o	ffer to help find or	ut.	99.00	Billable
3/29/2006 LEF Reviewed email from SGT to MUX, "let us know what you did as far as disseminating via email notice of the Sony-BMG Rootkit settlement" with response; "here are the groups I sent to, Dmusic, Boycott-RIAA, the notice network list. 3/29/2006 LEF 495.00 0.20 99.00 Billat Reviewed email from C. Cohn giving telephone number for conference; LEF asking which phone is involved.		at 5:00 p.m. to close loop on final decision regarding fee apneed to decide whether to accept/reject latest "offer" or file of	plication. In ess	ence, we		
via email notice of the Sony-BMG Rootkit settlement" with response; "here are the groups I sent to, Dmusic, Boycott-RIAA, the notice network list. 3/29/2006 LEF 495.00 0.10 49.50 Billat Reviewed email from C. Cohn giving telephone number for conference; LEF asking which phone is involved.	3/29/2006		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
Reviewed email from C. Cohn giving telephone number for conference; LEF asking which phone is involved.		via email notice of the Sony-BMG Rootkit settlement" with re	esponse; "here ar			
which phone is involved.	3/29/2006	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	3/30/2006	which phone is involved.		· ·	99 00	Billable
Reviewed email from C. Cohn, re: forgot to raise this yesterday, "what should I do about					00.00	Billable

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 37

Date	User Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
_	the delegation agreement?" Given the way things have gone Counsel, I am not inclined to sign us up for any more involved				
3/30/2006	current auspices. LEF	495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from J. Friedman to C. Cohn, re: "what about language and sending it back?".	it striking the offe	ending		
3/30/2006		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from S. Scarlett, so – we need clarification of in saying that not all MM "phone home", but that some do? (a capability, but some do), C. Cohn responding "yes".				
3/30/2006		495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from S. Scarlett, can someone send me the to Sony?, Tx SES	November 15 G	ireen letter		
3/30/2006	· ·	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from Alvin Sharma enclosing letter to Jeff Cu contact Green Welling, re: letter sent to Sony BMG asking pri problems generated by music CDs.				
3/30/2006		495.00	0.20	99.00	Billable
	Reviewed email from SGT to Friedman attaching, in PDF formalong with exhibit A - firm resume, exhibit B - pre-bill workshe		ration,		
3/30/2006	LEF	495.00	0.10	49.50	Billable
	Reviewed email from SGT attaching Sony Rootkit Declaration	ı. -			
TOTAL	Billable Fees		200.47	=	\$80,883.50
Date	User Expense	Price Markup %	Quantity	Amount	Total
1/24/2006	LEF	25.00	1.000	25.00	Billable
1/31/2006	Certificate of Good Standing. REW	11.26	1.000	11.26	Billable
2/28/2006	Overnight delivery to Robert M. Rothman, Esquire. REW	11.31	1.000	11.31	Billable
	Overnight delivery to Tammy Martinez, Deputy Clerk, New Yor	k.			
TOTAL	Billable Costs		_	=	\$47.57
				Amount	Total
Total of Fee	s (Time Charges)		_		\$80,883.50

Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates Pre-bill Worksheet

Page 38

	Amount	Total
Total of Costs (Expense Charges)		\$47.57
Total new charges	-	\$80,931.07
Total New Balance	-	\$80,931.07

	User Sum	nmary			
User	Rate	Hours	Charges	Slip Value	Adjustment
LEF	495.00	132.47	\$65,571.00	\$65,571.00	0.00
MJ	90.00	24.00	\$2,160.00	\$2,160.00	0.00
REW	325.00	5.75	\$1,868.75	\$1,868.75	0.00
ST	295.00	38.25	\$11,283.75	\$11,283.75	0.00

LAWRENCE E. FELDMAN & ASSOCIATES

LAWRENCE E. FELDMAN

LAWRENCE E. FELDMAN graduated cum laude from Dickinson College in 1974, and Boston College Law School in 1978. He is a member of the bars of the Pennsylvania Supreme Court, the United States District Court for the Eastern District of Pennsylvania, the Massachusetts Supreme Judicial Court and the United States District Court for the District of Massachusetts.

Mr. Feldman practiced in the Boston area from 1979 to 1980 as associate in-house counsel with Walter E. Heller & Company, a Fortune 500 company. From 1980 to 1982, he was an associate with the Philadelphia firm of Kramer & Salus, a firm specializing in civil and class action litigation. Since 1982, he has been in private practice first with Needle and Feldman, and then under his own name. Mr. Feldman has been involved in a number of large class actions, including *In Re First Pennsylvania Securities Litigation*, No. 80-1643 (E.D. Pa.); *Bergman v. Sanders*, No. 79-3662 (E.D.Pa.); *In re Eastern Sugar Antitrust Litigation*, 697 F.2d 524 (E.D.Pa. 1983)(\$35 million dollar settlement); *Eisenberg v. Gagnon*, (E.D.Pa.): *In re VMS Funds Securities Litigation* (\$100 million settlement); *U.S. Healthcare Securities Litigation* (\$5 million settlement); *National Media Securities Litigation*, (\$2.7 million settlement); *In re Centocor Securities Litigation* (\$18 million dollar settlement); *In re Coleco* (1987) *Sherin v. Commodore*, 1987-U.S. Lexis 9698 (E.D. Pa.1987); *Grasty v. Amalgamated Local* 80 IBEW (3rd Cir). Mr. Feldman was also the chief negotiator in *Curley v. Cumberland Farms*, which resulted in a \$10 million settlement (\$6.5 million settlement after a Chapter 11 filing).

Mr. Feldman recently served as lead counsel in *In re Gateway 2000, Inc.*, No. 96-08-SD-01659 (Phila. Ct. of Common Pleas, 1996) and *Novacheck v. CIGNA* (C.D. Cal. 95-3566). He currently serves as counsel for the plaintiffs in *Moore v. American Federation Television & Radio Artists* (N.D. GA, Atlanta 1993); and *Chambers v. Time Warner*, C.A. No. 00-2839 (JSR) (groundbreaking litigation asserting digital distribution rights for legendary musicians). Other class actions in which Mr. Feldman is involved include *Solomon v. Mass Mutual* (Phila. Cty. Ct. Common Pleas, 1996); *PaineWebber R&D Partners, L.P. & Petrisko v. Centocor, Inc.*, No. 96C-04-194 (WTQ) (Superior Ct. Del.); *Hurwitz v. Dow Corning, Inc.* (MDL Docket No. 94-P-14264-S); *Hecht v. Medaphis Corporation*, No. L-12691-96 (Superior Court of N.J., Essex City); *Alten v. Security Connecticut*, (Phila. Ct. of Common Pleas, 1997); *Feinberg v. Toshiba* (N.J. Super. 2000); and *In re CD MAP Antitrust Litigation* (D.C. Maine, 2000). He has also served in *In Re Diet Drug Litigation*, on the steering committee of the Pennsylvania certified class action for medical monitoring in connection with litigation concerning the diet drug Fen-Phen.

Mr. Feldman has lectured on entertainment, copyright and trademark litigation at Temple University. He has also represented well-known entertainers and companies in the music industry.

ROSEANN E. WEISBLATT

ROSEANN E. WEISBLATT received her Bachelor of Science degree from Thomas Jefferson University of Allied Health Sciences in 1981 and earned her law degree at the Temple University School of Law in 1994. She was a Legal Intern to the Hon. William H. Lederer, Pennsylvania Commonwealth Court (1992). Ms. Weisblatt is admitted to the state bars of Pennsylvania, New Jersey, the Eastern District of Pennsylvania and the Third Circuit Court of Appeals. She is a member of the Philadelphia Bar Association, Montgomery County Bar Association, Pennsylvania Trial Lawyers Association and serves as adjunct faculty in the Paralegal Studies Program at Manor Junior College.

Ms. Weisblatt has participated in a number of class actions, including In re PaineWebber Limited Partnerships Litigation (S.D. N.Y.); Hagen v. America Online (Sup.Ct. CA 1995); Solomon v. Mass Mutual (Phila. Cty. Ct. Common Pleas, 1996); Alten v. Security Connecticut, (Phila. Cty. Ct. of Common Pleas, 1997); In re Gateway 2000 (Phila.Cty. Ct. Common Pleas 1996); Moore v. American Federation Television & Radio Artists (N.D.GA, Atlanta Div.1993). Ms. Weisblatt has also played a key role in the litigation and settlement of several Medical malpractice and intellectual property lawsuits.

STEVEN G. TYSON

STEVEN G. TYSON received his Bachelor of Arts degree from Eastern College in 1990 and earned his law degree at the Temple University School of Law in 1998. Mr. Tyson is admitted to the state bars of Pennsylvania and New Jersey, to the District of New Jersey, and to the Eastern District of Pennsylvania.

Since March of 1999 when he joined the Firm, Mr. Tyson has been extensively involved in the Fen-Phen products liability class action and numerous individual product liability actions. Mr. Tyson also represents famous musicians in various trademark and contract matters, and successfully defended a production company in the second ever ICANN Internet domain name dispute.

Lawrence E. Feldman, declares as follows:

- 1. I am an attorney in good standing, duly licensed and admitted to practice in the Supreme Court of Pennsylvania (June 1981), Supreme Court of Massachusetts (December 1978), Eastern District of Pennsylvania (June 1981), Second Circuit Court of Appeals (March 2001), and Sixth Circuit Court of Appeals (February 2006). I am a principle of Lawrence E. Feldman & Associates, counsel of record for Tom Ricciuti, Yvonne Ricciuti, and Mary Schumacher, in Ricciuti, et al. v. Sony BMG Music Entertainment Corp., et al., 05-cv-10190, S.D.N.Y., and for Robert Hull, Joseph Halpin, and Edwin Bonner in Hull, et al. v. Sony BMG Music Entertainment Corp., et al., Case No. BC343385, Superior Court of California, L.A. County. A true and correct copy of the firm resume is attached hereto as Exhibit A and incorporated by reference herein.
- 2. I submit this declaration in support of Plaintiffs' application for attorneys' fees and reimbursements of expenses in the above-entitled matter. The testimony set forth in this declaration is based on first-hand knowledge, about which I would and could testify competently in open court if called upon to do so, and on contemporaneously-generated records kept in the ordinary course of business.
- 3. The total number of professional hours expended in the litigation by Lawrence E. Feldman & Assoc. is 197.77. The total lodestar amount for attorney, paralegal and professional staff time expended by Lawrence E. Feldman in the course of the litigation, based upon current rates, is \$79,547.00. The chart attached hereto as Exhibit B was prepared at my direction and represents a summary of the time spent from November 21, 2005, through March 30, 2006, on the litigation by attorneys, paralegals and professional staff of the firm. The chart includes the name of each attorney, paralegal and professional staff member who has worked on the case, his or her current hourly billing rate, and the number of hours expended by each professional on this

matter. The time reflected in this declaration was time actually spent, in the exercise of reasonable judgment, by the lawyers and staff involved, and includes factual investigation into the experience of, and client contact with, named plaintiff Mary Schumacher, assisting in the drafting of the complaints and subsequent motions, planning strategy with co-counsel, and disseminating notice of settlement to over 400,000 potential class members through its law firm website www.leflaw.com, and its other websites www.dmusic.com. My firm was careful not to expend unnecessary hours and not to duplicate work done by others.

4. The firm expended a total of \$47.57 in unreimbursed expenses in connection with prosecution of the litigation on behalf of Tom Ricciuti, Yvonne Ricciuti, Mary Schumacher, Robert Hull, and Joseph Halpin. The expenses incurred in this case are reflected in the books and records of the firm. These books and records are prepared from expense vouchers, check records, and other contemporaneously-recorded billing records, are an accurate record of expenses incurred in this litigation. The chart attached hereto as Exhibit B details these expenses.

I declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the United States of America and the State of New York that the foregoing is true and correct.

Executed this 30 day of Mode , 2006, at Elkins Park, Pennsylvania.

Lawrence É. Feldman